CITY OF MONTCLAIR

AGENDA FOR CITY COUNCIL, SUCCESSOR AGENCY,
AND MONTCLAIR HOUSING CORPORATION MEETINGS,
AND MONTCLAIR HOUSING AUTHORITY MEETINGS

To be held in the Council Chambers
5111 Benito Street, Montclair, California

November 18, 2013
7:00 p.m.

As a courtesy please silenice your celf phones and other electronic devices while the meeting is in
session. Thank you.

The CC/SA/MHC/MHA meetings are now available in audio format on the City'’s website at
www.ci.montclair.ca.us and can be accessed the day following the meeting after 10:00 a.m.

VI

Page No,

CALL TO ORDER - City Council, Successor Agency and Montclair Housing
Corporation Boards of Directors, and Montclair Housing
Authority Commissioners

INVOCATION

In keeping with our fong-standing tradition of opening our Council
meetings with an invocation, this City Counci! Meeting may include
a nonsectarian invocation. Such invocations are not intended to
proselytize or advance any faith or belief or to disparage any faith or
belief. Neither the City nor the City Council endorse any particufar
refigious befief or form of invocation.

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
ROLL CALL

PRESENTATIONS.
A. Introduction of New Employee and Promotee

B. Recognition of Fruit Park Participants
PUBLIC COMMENT

This section is intended to provide members of the public with an oppor-
tunity to comment on any subject that does not appear on this agenda.
f£ach speaker will be afforded five minutes to address the City Councif
Members, Successor Agency Board of Directors, Montclair Housing
Corporation Board of Directors, and Moniclair Housing Authority
Commissioners. (Government Code Section 54854.3)

Under the provisions of the Brown Act, the Council/Successor Agency
Board/MHC Board/-MHA Commission is prohibited from taking action on
items not listed on the agenda.



Vil. PUBLIC HEARINGS

A. First Reading - Consnder Adoption of Ordmance No. 13-938 Amendmg

- Specific Chapters of Title 10 of the Montclair Municipal Code Related
to Adoption of Building Codes to Regulate Construction in the City of
Montclair and to Establish January 1, 20l4 as the Effective Date of
the Codes [CC] - .

VIl CONSENT CALENDAR

A Approval of Mmutes '

1.

Mmutes of the Regular Joint Counc:I/SucceSSOr Agency Board/
MHC Board/MHA Commission Meeting. of November 4, 2013
[CC/SA/MHC/MHA]

-B. Admmlstrattve Reports - '

1.
2.

10.

171.

12.

ConSIder Recewmg and Fihng of Treasurers Report [CC]

Consider Approval of Warrant Register- and PayroEI

Documentations [CC]

Consider Receiving and Filing of Treas_u're"r’srRep(VJr't [SA]
Consider Approvral‘.,of Warrant Register_ [SA}- - |
Consider Receiving and F.ili'ng of Treas'ﬁrér"s Report IMHC]-
Consider Approval .o‘f Warrant Register 7[MHC] _
Consider Receiving and Filing of Treasurer’s Re;ﬁort [MHA]
Consider Approval of Warrant Registe_r [MHA]

Consider Authorization to Purchase One 2013 Honda Civic
Hybrid Sedan From Penske Honda Ontario [CC]

Consider Authorization of a $9,500 Appropriation From the
Economic Developmeant Fund for Signage Improvements

- Associatad With the Civic Center Sign Projec_t- [CC]

Consider Approval of the Filing of a Notice of Completion for
the 5444 Palo Verde Street Improvement Project {MHA]

Consider Authorizing Release of Retention 30 Days After
Recordation of Notice of Completion [MHA]

Consider Authorization to Purchase One 2014 Chevrolet
2500HD Pickup Truck [CC]

C. Agreements

1.

Consider Approval of Agreement No. 13-91-1-89, an Irrevocable
Annexation Agreement With Josey Chavez for 4743 Howard Street
(Assessor's Parcel No. 1012-331-05) [CC]

.Page No.

18

19
"0
21
22
23
24

25

26

28

29

32

33



. Page Nog. -
D. . Resolutions

1. Consider Adoption of Resolution No. 13-3015 Setting a Public
Hearing For January 20, 2014, Related to a Proposed Five-Year -
Schedule of Maximum Monthly Rate Caps for Residential and
Commercial Refuse Services Pursuant To Proposition 218

~ Notification, Protest, and Public Hearing Process and Directmg
that Notice Thereto Be Provided to Property Owners of Record
Upon Which Proposed. Fees Would Be Imposed {ccl

“Consider Authorlzmg Staff to Send Notlces to Property Owners -
Regarding a Workshop and Public Hearing to Consider Establish-
ing Maximum Monthly Residential and Commercial Rate Caps for
Refuse Services Pursuant-to Proposmon 218 Requirements {CC]

Consider Allocating Up to $12,000 From the Contingency Fund to

Mail Notices of a Proposition 218 Public Hearing to Property Owners
Regarding Establishing a Five-Year Schedule of MaXImum'Monthly '

Rate Caps for Residential and Commercial Refuse Serwces [CC] _ 39 .

1X. PULLED CONSENT CALENDAR ITEMS
X. RESPONSE - None

Xl. COMMUNICATIONS

City Attorney _

City Manager/Executive Director
Mayor/Chairman

Council/MHC Board

m o N ® »

Committee Meeting Minutes (for informational purposes only)

1. Minutes of the Personnel Committee Meeting of November 4, .
2013 . _ 68

XIt.  COUNCIL WORKSHOP ‘
A. Community Relations Unit Update

{Council may consider continuing this item to an adjourned meeting on
Monday, December 2,2013, at 5:45 p.m. in the City Council Chambers.)'

XIl.  ADJOURNMENT OF CITY COUNCIL, SUCCESSOR AGENCY AND
: MONTCLAIR HOUSING CORPORATION BOARDS OF DIRECTORS, AND
MONTCLAIR HOUSING AUTHORITY COMMISSIONERS

The next regularly scheduled City Council, Successor Agency Board, Montclair Housing Corporation
Board, and Montclair Housing Authority Commission meetings will be held on Monday, December 2,
2073, at 7:00 p.m. in the Council Chambers.
Reports, backup materials, and additional materials related to any item on this Agenda dfstrfbuted
to the City Council, Successor Agency Board, Montclair Housing Corporation Board, and Montclair
Housing Authority Commission after distribution of the Agenda packet are available for public.
inspection in the Office of the City Clerk focated at 5111 Benito Street, Monic/air, California, between
7:00 am. and 6:00 p.m., Monday through Thursday.
In compliance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, if you need special assistance to participate
in this meeting, please contact the Deputy City Clerk at (909) 625-9416. Notification 48 hours prior
to the meeting will enable the City to make reasonable arrangements to ensure accessibility to this
meeting. (28 CFR 35.102-35,104 ADA Title 1)
[ Yvonne L. Smith, Deputy City Clerk, hereby certify that | posted, or caused to be posted, a copy of
this Agenda not less than 72 hours prior to this meeting on the bulletin board adjacent to the north
door of Montclair City Hall on November 14, 201 3.

3



AGENDAREPQRT .

SUBJECT: CONSIDER ADOPTION OF ORDINANCE " . DATE: = November 18,2013
: NO. 13-938 AMENDING SPECIFIC CHAPTERS o
OF TITLE 10 OF THE MONTCLAIR MUNICIPAL ~ SECTION:  PUBLIC HEARINGS
CODE RELATED TO ADOPTION OF BUILDING s
' CODES TO REGULATE CONSTRUCTION (N THE TTEMNOZ = A
- CITY OF MONTCLAIR AND TO ESTABLISH SRR
* JANUARY 1, 2014, AS THE EFFECTIVE DATE 100 D COV100 -

OF THE CODES . DEPT:  COMMUNITY DEV.
FIRST READENG

REASON FOR CONSIDERATION Amendments to the Montcialr Mum(:lpa! Code requnre ,
public hearing review and approval by the City Councﬂ B L

BACKGROUND: The California Health and Safety Code establishes a Bwldlng Standards_,
Commission, whose duties include approval, codification, and publication of building
standards in a triennial edition of the California Building Standards Code. These codes,
commonly called Title 24, incorporate the latest editions of the model codes that apply
in all parts of California. The commission also establishes a date that these codes
become effective throughout the State; the date for this triennial edition is January 1,
2014. The adoption of these codes would regulate the fabrication, construction, - -
‘enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal, demolition, conversion, occupancy,
equipment, use, height, area, or other |mprovements to real propérty; maintenarice of
all buildings or structures in the City of Montclair; and providing for issuance of permits
and collection of fees therefore.

The Building Standards Code does not include adoption of procedural ordinances by
a City or other agency related to civil, administrative, or criminal procedures and
remedies available for enforcing code violations. In addition, this Ordinance does not
address the 2013 California Fire Code adoption. : '

FISCAL IMPACT: The cost to publish a Notice of Public Hearing in the Inland Valley
Daily Bulletin related to Ordinance No. 13-938 should not exceed $400.

RECOMMENDATION: Staff recommends the City Council adopt the first reading
of Ordinance No. 13-938 amending various chapters in Title 10 of the Montclair
Municipal Code related to adoption of building codes to regulate construction in the
City of Montclair and to establish January 1, 2014, as the effective date of the codes.

27
/%r/ 'ewed Ind /;ﬁaﬁs\
Prepared by: pproved by: M W}“\

Proofed by Presented by:

4 -



ORDINANCE NO. 13-938

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF

" THE CITY OF MONTCLAIR AMENDING SPECIFIC -

- CHAPTERS OF TITLE10 OF THE MONTCLAIR
MUNICIPAL CODE AND ADOPTING BY REFERENCE
THE 2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING

~* CODE, VOLUMES 1 AND 2, INCLUDING APPENDIX .

- CHAPTERS "C," "F," "I, AND "}"; THE 2013 EDITION -
OF THE CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE; THE 2013
EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE;
THE 2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA ELECTRI-
CAL CODE; THE 2013 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA .~
MECHANICAL CODE; AND THE 2013 EDITION OF -
THE CALIFORNIA GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS
CODE, TOGETHER WITH CERTAIN AMENDMENTS,
ADDITIONS, DELETIONS, AND EXCEPTIONS INCLUD-
ING FEES AND PENALTIES o

WHEREAS, the California Health and Safety Code establishes a Building -
Standards Commission whose duties include approval, codification, and
publication of building standards in a triennial edition of the Cahfornla Buxldmg"
Standards Code, commonly called Title 24; and : :

WHEREAS, the Building. Standards Commission also establishes a date. '
that these codes become effective throughout the state; and '

WHEREAS, the effective date for this triennial ed|t|on is January 1, 201 4:
and oo

WHEREAS, adoption of these codes would regulate the fabrication,
construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, moving, removal, demolition,
conversion, occupancy, equipment, use, height, area, or other improvements to
real property; maintenance of all bwldmgs or structures in the City of Montclair;
and provision for issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and

WHEREAS the Building Standards Code does not include adoptlon of
procedural ordinances by a city or other agency related to civil, administrative,
or criminal procedures and remedies available for enforcing code violations.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MONTCLAIR
" DOES HEREBY ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section L Section 0.08.010 of the Montclair Municipal Code is
hereby amended as follows:

10.08.010 Adoption.

Except as provided in this eChapter, those certain building codes known and
designated as the California Building Code, 26162013 Edition, Volumes 1 and 2,
including Appendix Chapters "C," "F," " ," and "J," based on the 286692012
International Building Code as publlshed by the International Code Council, shall

Ordinance No. 13-938 5 Page 1 of 13



be and become the Building Codes of the City of Montclair for regulating the
construction, alteration, movement, enlargement, replacement,. repair, equip-
“ment, use and occupancy,- location, maintenance, removal and demolition of
every building and/or structure or any appurtenances connected or attached to-
‘such buildings or structures throughout the €City. The California Building Code
and its appendix chapters will be on flle for public exammatlon in the office of -
the Bmldmg OfﬁCIaI ‘ : :

Sectlon L Section 10.08.020 of the Montclair Mumapal Code |5j -
" hereby deleted in its entsrety and replaced as fo[lows

1 0.08.020 Building Code amendments.

The following Section of Chapter 1, "Scope and Adm[nlstratton Dlws:onl :
_California Administration," is hereby amended as follows ' : -

1.8.8 Appeals Board Subsect;on 1.8.8 is hereby deleted in its entlrety

The following portions and sections of Chapter 1, "Scope and Admmlstration
Division I, Scope and Administration,” are hereby amended as follows

The followmg !anguage shall be added to Subsection 101 .2, 'Scope”:

In order to properly maintain and safeguard healthful living Cthit.ions ;
~and comply with all provisions of the Building Codes, it is hereby declared . -

unlawful to use any streetcars, boxcars, house cars, motor bus bodies, or . -

similar means of conveyance or structures of similar nature of:
construction, for places of habitation, residence, or place of business in
this City. However, nothing contained herein shall prohibit the use of any
house trailer or mobile home for places of abode or habitation in an
approved mobile home park, provided such structures comply with all
other conditions and requirements of this Code.

The following Ianguage shall be added to Subsection 1 02.1, "General";

If any section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph, sentence, Clause or
phrase of this Code or any part thereof is in conflict with the Fire Code _
the most restrictive shall be applicable.

Subsection 104.1, "General," of Section 104, "Duties and Powers of Building
Official," is hereby deleted in its entirety and replaced as follows:

104.1 General. The Building Officiai is hereby authorized and directed to
enforce all the provisions of this Code and referenced technical: codes.
For such purposes, the Building Official shall have the powers of a law
enforcement officer. The Building Official shall have the power to render
interpretations of this Code and the referenced technical codes, and to
adopt and enforce rules and regulations supplemental to this Code as
may be deemed necessary to clarify the application of the provisions of
this Code. Such interpretations, rules, and regulations shall be in
conformity with the intent and purpose of this Code.

Ordinance No. 13-938 6 Page 2 of 13



Subsection 104. 12, "Cooberation of Other Qfﬁcia'ls and Officers,"” shall be
added as follows: o S

104.12 Cooperatlon of Other Officials and Officers. The Building Official
may request and shall receive the assistance and cooperation of other

officials of this jurisdiction so far as is required in the discharge of the :

‘dutIeS requlred by th|s Code or other pertinent laws or ordmances

Subsectlon 105.2, "Work exempt from permit,” is hereby ‘amendedf as
follows: - o S

| Item 1 under "Building" is hereby amended as follows:

1. - One-story detached accessory. structures used as tool and.,stﬁdr_age S
sheds, playhouses and similar uses, provided the floor area does not -

* exceed 120 square feet or measures over 8 feet in helght to the hlghest .
point of the roof. :

ltem 2 under "Building" is hereby deleted in its entirety.

ltem 4 under "'Building“ is hereby deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows: _ )

4. Rétaining walls that are not over three (3) feet in height as méasured’
from the bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supportlng a
surcharge or |mpoundmg Class 1, II, or IlIA liquids.

Iltem 9 under "Building” is hereby deleted in its entlrety.

Subsection 105.3.2, "Time limitation of application," is hereby adopted and
amended to read as follows: _

Applications for which no permit is issued within 180 days following the
date of application shall expire by limitation. Plans and other data
submitted for review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or
destroyed by the Building Official. The Building. Official may extend the
time for action by the applicant for a period not exceeding 180 days on
written request by the applicant showing the circumstances beyond the
control of the applicant having prevented action from being taken. An
application shall not be extended more than once. An application shall
not be extended if this Code or any other pertinent laws or ordinances
have been amended subsequent to the date of application. In order to
renew action on an application after expiration, the applicant shall
resubmit plans and pay a new plan review fee. All plans submitted for
review prior to the effective date of this ordinance shall expire by
limitation within 180 days of application with no extensions.

Subsection 105.5, "Expiration,” is hereby adopted and amended to read as.
foliows: '

Ordinance No. 13-938 7 Page 3 of 13



Every permit issued by the Building Ofﬁaal under the provisions of the

- technical codés shall expire by limitation and become null and void, if the
building or work authorized by such permit is not commenced W|th|n 180
days from the date of such permit, or if the building or work authorized

" by such permit is suspended or abandoned at any time after the work is -
" commenced for a period of 180 days. Beforée such work can be
‘recommenced, a new permit shall be first obtained to do so, and the fee

. therefor shall be one-half the amount required for a new permit for such -
~work, provided no changes -have- been made or will be made in the
- original plans and specifications for such work, and prowded further that
such suspension or abandonment has not eXCeeded one year. In order to - .
renew action on a permlt after expiration, the perm:ttee sha!l pay a new -

- fult permlt fee. B .

A permlttee hoidmg an unexpfred permut may apply for an extension of
the time within which work may commence under the permit when the
permittee is unable to commence work within the time required by this
Section for good and satisfactory reasons. The Building Official may

-extend the time for action by the permittee for a period not exceeding
180 days upon written request by the "permittee showing that
circumstances beyond the control of the permittee have prevented action
from being taken. Permits shall not be extended more than once.

Section 107, Submltta! Documents is hereby adopted and amended as
foliows '

Subsection 107.5, "Retenti'on: of construction documents,” is hereby
~ amended by adding the following language: '

Before final inspection, electronic images of all plans, engineering
calculations, and records that are submitted for the purpose of obtaining
a building permit shall be submitted to the Building Official. Electronic
images shall be’ based on the Building Division's Electronic Archiving
Policy.

Section 109, "Fees," is hereby adopted and amended as follows:

Subsection 109.2, "Schedule of permit fees,“'is hereby amended by adding
the following language:

When submittal documents are required by Section 109, a plan review fee
shall be paid at the time of submittal of documents for plan review. Fees
~shall be assessed in accordance with the Development Review Fee
Schedule established by resolution of the City Council. When the City
retains a private entity or person to perform plan review, the plan review
fee shall be in an amount sufficient to defray the cost of such services,
plus a 15 percent fee to cover the cost of administration, but in no case
shall the plan review fee be less than the amount specified in this Section.

Subsection 109.4, "Work commencing before permit issuance," is hereby
deleted in its entirety and replaced as follows:

Ordinance No. 13-938 8 Page 4 0f 13



109.4 Work Commencing before permit issuance. Whenever work for .
which a permit is required by this Code has been commenced without
first obtaining a permit, a special investigation shall be made before a
permit may be issued for such work. An investigation fee, in addition to
- the permit fee, shall be collected whether or not a permit-is then or
subsequently issued. The investigation fee shall —be required. in
~accordance with the schedule as established by the appllcable governing
‘authority. - The minimum investigation fee shall be the same as the
minimum.fee set forth in accordance with the schedule as established by -
‘the applicable governing authority. The payment of such investigation
fee shall not exempt an applicant from compliance with all other -
provisions of either this Code or the technical codes, nor from the penalty
prescribed by law. Whenever the same person or entity is found to have
performed work for which a permit is required without first obtaining:
said permit four or more times, said investigation fee shall be ten times
the fee amount set forth in accordance with the schedule as establlshed'
by the applicable governing authority.

Subsectlon 109.6, "Refunds is hereby deleted in its entirety and réplac'ed a.s‘
follows: : o

109.6 Refunds. The Bqumg Official may authorize refundmg of a fee:
paid hereunder that was erroneously paid or collected. The Building
Official may authorize refunding of not more than 80 percent of the
" permit fee paid when no work has been done under a permit issued in
accordance with this Code. The Building Official may authorize refunding
of not more than 80 percent of the plan review fee paid when an
application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been paid is
withdrawn or cancelled before any examination time has been expended.
The Building Official shall not authorize the refunding of any fee paid
except upon written request filed by the original permlttee not later than
180 days after the date of payment.

Section 110, "Inspections,” is adopted and amended by adding the following
subsection: _

110.1.1 Workmanship. It is the intention of the City that all construction
carried on under the review of the Building Division is of good quality.
The Building Official shall be empowered to enforce the installation of
work that is straight, level, plumb, square, etc., as the situation requires.
All work shall be well fit and of a durable nature. Paint in all cases shall
not be below normal standard for the use applied. The proper grading of
walks, drives and yards shall be required when being installed with the
work requiring a building permit. A minimum thickness of 3% inches for
flat concrete work and 2 inches for asphalt paving shall be required. All
exterior flat concrete work shall include such breaks for expansion as
deemed necessary by the Building Official.

Subsection 110.3.4, "Frame mspectlon is hereby amended by adding the
foliowing language:

Ordinance No. 13-938 g Page 5 of 13



: The structure shall have lath paper complete[y mstalled at the time of*
framing mspectlon )

Subsection 110.3.5, "Lath and gypsum ' is hereby amended by de!et'ing the :
exceptson inits entlrety : ' :

Subsection 110,3.8, "Other insp'éctions," is hereby amehded' by adding the
~ follewing language: - o . ' S

A reinspect'ion' fee may be assessed for each in'spe'ct'io'n or _re'inSpe_ctio'n
- when such portion of work for which inspection-is called is not.complete
~ar when corrections called for are not made. This Section. is not to be

interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected -

for failure to comply with the requirements of the technical codes but.as =
controlling the practice of calling for inspections before the job is ready

for such inspection or reinspection. Reinspection fees may be assessed -
when the inspection record card is not posted or otherwise available on
the work site, the approved plans are not readily available to the
inspector, for failure to provide access on the date for which inspection is
requested, or deviation from plans requiring the approval of the Building
Official. To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall file an application

therefor in writing upon a form furnished for that purpose-and pay the ..

reinspection fee in accordance with a fee schedule adopted by this
~jurisdiction. In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed,
 additional inspection of the work will not be performed until the requlred
fees have been paid.

Subsection 110.5, “Inspection requests,” is hereby deleted in its entirety and
replaced as follows:

110.5 Inspection requests. It shall be the duty of the person doing the
work authorized by the permit to notify the Building Official that such
work is ready for inspection. The Building Official may require that every
request for inspection be filed at least one working day before such
inspection is desired. Such request may be requested in writing or by -
telephone at the option of the Building Official. It shall be the duty of the
person reqguesting any inspections required by either this Code or the
technical codes to provide access to and means for inspection of the
work.

Section 111, "Certificate of Occupancy,” is hereby adopted and amended by
adding the following subsection: :

111.5 Utility release.. The following minimum requirements shall be
completed prior to any occupancy or utility connection:

(1) Written clearance from the Fire and Public Works Departments and -
Planning and Business License Divisions.

(2) Written clearance from Monte Vista Water District, NPDES Coordinator
and Environmental Manager, when applicable.

(3) The following, when applicable:

Ordinance No. 13-938 10 Page 6 of 13



(@) Electronic imaging of plans received.

(b)Y Verification of school fees pald

(c) Grading certificate received.

(d) All plan review fees paid.

(e) Sewer assessment fees paid.

(f) Hazardous materials statements recelved

(g) Subcontractor's list received.

{h) - Parkland development fees received.

(i) Transportation development impact fees received

Section 114, "Violations,"is hereby adopted and amended as _foIIoWs':-

Subsection 114.4, "Violation ‘penalties‘," ‘is,hereby.amended' by add-ing the
followmg language: _ ' 5 T

- Whenever the same person or entity is found to have performed work for
which a permit is required without first obtaining said permit four or
more times, said investigation fee shall be ten times the fee amount setf
forth in Section 108.

| Section lli.' Sections 10.20.010 and 10.20.020 of the Montclair
Municipal Code are hereby amended as follows: : o

10.20.010 Adoption.

Except as provided in this Chapter, the California Electrical Code, 26462013
Edition, based on the 200682011 National Electrical Code as published by the
National Fire Protection Association, shall be and become the Electrical Code of
‘the City of Montclair, requlating all installation, arrangement, alteration, repair,
use, and other operation of electrical wiring, connections, fixtures, and other
electrical appliances on premises within the cCity. The Cahfornla Electrlcal Code
is on file for public examination in the office of the bBuilding oOfﬁaaI

10.20.020 Electrical code amendments.

The %6+92013 Edition of the California Electrlcal Code is hereby adopted
with no amendments

Section IV. Section 10.24.010 of the Montclair Municipal Code 15
hereby amended as follows:

10.24.010 Permit required - Fee.

No person shall erect or install any fence or block or masonry wall without
first obtaining a permit to do so from the Building Official. The fee for a fence
permit shall be pursuant to the City's Development Review Fee Schedule as
establlshed bv resoiutlon of the City_Council-fee—schedule—shown—in—thetatest

, which shall include the cost of inspection
of such fence. The fee for a block or masonry wall permit shall be in accordance
with the Develooment Rewew Fee Schedu1e as estabhshed bv reso!utlon of the

City Council-a

Ordinance No. 13-938 11 Page 7 of 13



Section V.  Sections 10.30.010 and 10.30.020 of the Montclair
Mumc:pal Code are hereby amended as follows - o

10.30. 0]0 Adoptlon ' '

Except as provided in this eChapter the Cahforma Green Standards Code
26102013 Edition, as published by the California Building Standards
Commission, shall be and become the Green Building Standards Code of the City
of Montclair, regulating and controlling the planning, design, operation, use and -

occupancy of every newly constructed building or structure in the City. The -

~ California Green Building Standards Code shall be on file for public examination
in the office of the Building Official. -

IO 30. 020 Green Building Standards Code amendments :
The 20162013 Edition of the California Green Buddmg Standards Code is -
hereby adopted with no amendments.

. SectionVI.  Sections 10.36.010 and 10.36.020 of the Montclair -
Municipal Code are hereby amended as follows: ' '

10.36.010 Adoption. _ : o

- Fxcept as provided in thls eChapter, the California Mechanical Code,
20102013 Edition, based on the 26692012 Uniform Mechanical Code as
published by the International Assaciation of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials
(IAPMO), shall be and become the Mechanical Code of the City_of Montclair,
regulating and controlling the design, construction, installation, quality of
materials, location, operation, and maintenance of heating, ventifating, cooling,
refrigeration systems, incinerators, and other miscellaneous heat-producing
appliances. The California Mechanical Code is on file for public examination in
the office of the Building Official.

10.36.020 Mechanical Code amendments.
The 26162013 Edition of the California Mechanical Code is hereby adopted
with no amendments.

Section VIl. . Sections 10.40.010 and 10.40:020 of the Montclair
Municipal Code are hereby amended as follows:

10.40.010 Adopticn.

Except as provided in this <Chapter, the California Plumbing Code,
26162013 Edition, based on the 26692012 Uniform Plumbing Code as
published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials
GAMPEYIAPMO), shall be and become the Plumbing Code of the City of
Montclair, regulating erection, installation, alteration, repair, relocation,
replacement, maintenance, or use of plumbing systems within the City. The
California Plumbing Code wiltbseis on file for public examination in the office of
the Building Official.

10.40.020 Plumbing Code amendments.

The 26+02013 Edition of the California Plumbing Code is hereby adopted
with no amendments.

Ordinance No. 13-938 12 Page 8 of 13



_ 'Se‘ction VII. Sectlon 10.42, 010 of the Montclair Mun|c1pal Code is
hereby amended as follows: ,

10.42.010 AdOptlon. R : ‘ _

Except as provided in this €Chapter, the California Residential Code,
26102013 Edition, based on the 28692012 International Residential Code, as
. published by the California Building Standards Commission, shall be and

become the Residential Building Code of the City_of Montclair, regulatirngr S

- construction, alteration,  movement, eﬂlargement replacement, repair,
equipment, use and occupancy, location, maintenance, removal and demolition .
of every detached one- and two-family dwelling and townhouse not more than
three stories above grade in height with a separate means of egress and
structures accessory thereto in the City. The California Residential Code wilt -
beis on file for public examination in the office of the Building Official. '

_ Section IX. Section 10.42.020 of the Montclair Mun:cupal Code is
-hereby deleted in its entirety and replaced as follows:

10.42.020 Residential Code amendments. _

The following portions and sections of Chapter] "Scope and Application,
Division I, California Administration," and Division ll, "Administration,” are
hereby amended as follows: ' ' :

1.8.4 Permits, Fees, Applications and Inspections. Section 1.8.4 is hereby
deleted in its entirety. :

1.8.8 Appeals Board. Section 1.8.8is hereby deleted in its entirety.

1.8.9 Unsafe Buildings or Structures. Section 1.8.9 is hereby deleted in
its entirety.

Section R105, "Permits," is hereby amended as follows:
ftem 1 under "Building” is hereby amended as follows:

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage
sheds, playhouses and similar uses, provided the floor area does not
exceed 120 square feet or measures over eight (8} feet in height to the
highest point of the roof.

ftem 2 under "Building” is hereby deleted in its entirety.

ttem 3 under "Building" is hereby deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows: -

3. Retaining walls that are not over three feet in height as measured
from the bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a
surcharge or impounding Class 1, ii, or [lIA liquids.

ltem 7 under "Building" is hereby deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows:

Ordinance No. 13-938 13 Page 9 of 13



7. Prefabrlcated swmtmlng pools that are capable of contammg water to
a depth of not more than 12 inches.

Section R109, Inspectlon, is hereby ado_pted and amended by adding the |
foilowmg subsections: R

R109.0.1 Workmansh|p It is the intention of the City that all
~constriction carried on under the review of the Building Division is of
good quality. The Building Official shall be empowered to enforce the,
installation of work that is straight, level, plumb, square, etc., as the
situation requires. All work shall be well fit and of a durable hature.

Paint in all cases shall not be below normal standard for the use applied.

The proper grading of walks, drives and yards shall be required when
being installed with the work requiring a building permit. A minimum .
thickness of 3 1/2 inches for flat concrete work and 2 inches for asphalt -
paving shall be required. All exterior flat concrete work shall include =
such breaks for expansion as deemed necessary by the Building Official.

- Subsection R109.1.4, "Frame and masonry inspection,” is héreby amended by
adding the following Ianguage' S

The structure shall have lath paper completely enstalled at the time of.
frammg inspection. -

Subsection R109.1.5, "Other mspectlons ‘is hereby amended by adding the
following language: E

" A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or reinspection
when such portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete
or when corrections called for are not made. This Section is not to be
interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected
for failure to comply with the requirements of the technical codes but as
controlling the practice of calling for inspections before the job is ready
for such inspection or reinspection. Reinspection fees may be assessed
when the inspection record card is not posted or otherwise available on
the work- site, the approved plans are not readily available to the
inspector, for failure to provide access on the date for which inspection is
requested, or deviation from plans requiring the approval of the Building
Official. To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall file an application
therefor in writing upon a form furnished for that purpose and pay the
reinspection fee in accordance with a fee schedule adopted by this
jurisdiction. In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed,
additional inspection of the work will not be performed until the required
fees have been paid.

Section X. Section 10.56.020 of the Montclair Municipal Code is
hereby deleted in its entirety and replaced as follows:

1 10.56.020 Administrative Code amendments.
The following portions and sections of the Administrative Code are amended
as follows:

Ordinance No. 13-938 14 Page 10 of 13



Subsectionir10_l.3,' "Sc.ope,"' is hereby amended by.a_d_ding the following
[anguage ' : : : o T

In order to properly maintain and safeguard healthful living COf‘IdItIOﬂS :
and comply with all provisions of the latest adopted codes, It is declared
- unfawful to use any streetcars, boxcars, house cars, motor bus bodies, or
similar means of conveyance, or.structurés of similar nature of.

construction, for places of habitation, residence, or place of business in =

this City provided, however, that nothing contained herein shall prohibit
the use of any house trailer or mobile home for places of abode or
habitation in an approved mobile home park, provided such structyres
“comply with all other conditions and requirements of this Code.

Subsection 301.2.1, "Building permits,” is hereby amended as follows:
Item 2 is hereby deleted in its entirety.
ltem 5 is. amended to read as follows:

Retaining walls that are not over three feet in helght measured from the
bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supportlng a
surcharge or impounding Class 1, I, or HI-A liquids.

Item 11 is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Subsection 304.1, "General,” is hereby deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows: ' ' ' ' :

Fees shall be assessed in accordance with the Development Review Fee
Schedule as established by resolution of the City Council of the City of
Montclair. For buildings, structures, electrical, plumbing, mechanical,
gas or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for each permit shall be paid
in accordance with said fee schedule.

Subsection 304.2, "Permit Fees," is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Subsection 304.3, "Plan Review Fees," paragraph oné, is hereby deleted in its
entirety and replaced as follows: '

When submittal documents are required by Subsection 302.2, a plan
review fee shall be paid at the time of submittal of documents for plan
review. The plan review fee shall be established in the Development
Review Fee Schedule as established by resolution of the City Council of
the City of Montclair.

Subsection 304.3, "Plan Review Fees," paragraph two, is hereby deleted in its
entirety and replaced as follows:

The plan review fees for electrical, mechanical and plumbing work shall
be established in the Development Review Fee Schedule as established by
resolution of the City Council of the City of Montclair.

Ordinance No. 13-938 | 15 Page 11 of 13



_ Subsection 304.3, "Plan-Review'Fees," paragraph three, is hereby deleted in
its entirety and replaced as fo!IOWS' ' o '

When a plan for grading work is requlred to -be submitted, a plan review
fee shall be paid at the time of submitting plans and specrﬂcat[ons for
review. Said grading plan review fees are established by resolution of the
. City Councﬂ of the City of Montclair.. Separate plan review fees shall -
apply to -retaining walls of major drainage structures as reqwred
- elsewhere in th|s Code ' : o

‘Subsection 304.3, "Plan Review Fees,” is hereby amended. by adding the
~ following language: ' : : : : .

When the City retains a private entity or person to perform pilan review,
the plan review fee shall be in an amount sufficient to defray the cost of
~ such services, plus a 15 percent fee 1o cover the cost of administration,
~ but in no case shall the plan review fee be less than the amount specrfled
in this Section.

Subsection 304.5.2, "Fee,” is hereby deleted in its entirety and replaced as
“follows: '

~Whenever the same person or entity is found to have performed work for -
which a permit is required without first obtaining said permit four or
more times, said investigation fee shall be ten times the fee amount set
forth in the adopted Development Review Fee Schedule.

Section 305, “Inspections,” is hereby amended by adding the following
subsection:

305.9 Workmanship. It is the intention of the City that all construction
carried on under the review of the Building Division be of good quality.
The Building Official shall be empowered to enforce the installation of
work which is straight, level, plumb, square, etc., as the situation
requires. All work shall be well fit and of a durable nature. Paint in all
cases shall not be below normal standard for the-use applied. The proper
grading of walks, drives and yards shall be required when being installed
with the work requiring a building permit. A minimum thickness of 3% -
inches for flat concrete work and 2 inches for asphalt paving shall be
required. All exterior flat concrete work shall include such breaks for
expansion as deemed necessary by the Building Official.

Section 309, "Certificate of Occupancy,” is hereby deleted in its entirety.
Table 3-A, "Building Permit Fees," is hereby deleted in its entirety.

| Table 3-B, "Electrical Permit Fees," is hereby deleted ir1 its entirety.
Table 3-C, "Mechanical Permit Fees," is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Table 3-D, "Plumbing Permit Fees," is hereby deleted in its entirety.

Ordinance No. 13-938 16 Page 12 of 13



Table 3-E, "E!evator Permit Fees " s herel:iy deleted in its ent’irety.

Table 3-F, "Elevator Annual Certtflcates of Inspecﬂon Fees," is hereby deleted
inits, entirety. ‘

“Section XI. Severability. '

If any sectlon subsectlon subdmsmn paragraph, sentence clause, or
phrase of this Ordmance or any part thereof is for any reason held to be
unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining
- portion of this Ordinance or any part thereof. The City Council hereby declares
~ that it would have passed each section, subsection, subdivision, paragraph,
sentence, clause, or phrase thereof irrespective of the fact that any one or more
sections, subsections, subdivisions, paragraphs, sentences, clauses, or phrases
be declared unconstltutlonal

- Section Xil. Effective Date.

This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect thirty (30) days after
passage. ' : : : .

Sectlon XHL Posting

The City Clerk shall certify to the passage of this Ordlnance and cause the
same to be posted pursuant to Government Code Section 36933.

APPROVED AND ADOPTED this XX day of XX, 2013.

Mayor
ATTEST:

Deputy City Clerk

|, Yvonne L. Smith, Deputy City Clerk of the City of Montclair, DO HEREBY

CERTIFY that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of Ordinance No. 13-938

of said City, which was introduced at a regular meeting of the City Council held

on the XX day of XX, 2013, and finally passed not less than five (5} days
thereafter on the XX day of XX, 2013, by the following vote, to-wit:

AYES: XX
NOES: XX
ABSTAIN: XX
ABSENT: XX

Yvonne L. Smith
Deputy City Clerk

Ordinance No. 13-938 17 Page 13 of 13



AGENDA REPORT

SUBJECT:  CONSIDER RECEIVING AND FILNG OF .~ DATE:  November 18, 2013

| © TREASURER'S REPORT | e
| AR " SECTION: - ADMIN. REPORTS

TEMNO. 1

“FLELD: - FIN520

DEPT: ADMINiSVCS. .

?_ REASON FOR CONSIDERATION The Clty Councrl 1s requested to consider recelvmg and
filing'the City of Montclalr Treasurer 's Report for the month ending October 31, 201 3,
‘pursuant to state Iaw :

" BACKGROUND Included in your agenda packet is a copy of the Treasurer's Report for the
‘period ending. October 31, 2013.

FISCAL IMPACT ‘Routine—report. of Clty s cash and mvestments

'RECOMMENDATION Staff recommends the City Council receive and frle the Treasurer S
Report for the month endlng October’ 31 2013,

Reviewed and
Approved by:

Prepared by:

. Presented by:

Proofed by: Qymz {(’/6”

18



AGENDA REPORT

SUBJECT:  CONSIDER APPROVAL OF WARRANT REGISTER DATE:  November18, 2013
| * AND PAYROLL DOCUMENTATIONS - | |
SECTION:  ADMIN. REPORTS
ITEMNO: 2
FILE LD FINS40 .

DEPT.:_ ADMIN, SVCS.

: REASON FOR CONSIDERAT!ON The Clty CounCII is requested to consider approva! of the

o Warrant Reglster and two Payroll Documentatlons

_ BACKGROUND Mayor-Pro Tem Ruh has examined the Warrant Register dated November 1 8
2013; the Payroll Documentation dated September 22, 2013;-and the Payroll Documentation
dated October 6, 2013; finds them to be in order; and recommends their approval.

FISCAL IMPACT: The Warrant Register dated November 18, 2013, totals $1,748,083.93.

- The Payroll Documentation dated September 22, 2013, totals $556,570.61, with

$387,455.22 being the total cash disbursement. The Payroll Documentation dated
‘October 6, 2013, totals $567,959.02, w;th $395 036.20 belng the total cash
“disbursement. -

RECOMMENDATION: Staff recomrmre.nds the City Council approve the above referenced
Warrant Register and Payroll Documentations as presented.

%}'\W kg) ,:% é Reviewed end
Prepared by: ) Approved by:

Proofed by: W Do ,ng/?"* Presented by"

19 ' /




AGEN’DA REPORT

SUBJECT: CONSIDER RECEIVING AND FILING OF - DATE: - November 18,2013
' "~ TREASURER'S REPORT - o : ' -
SECTION:  ADMIN. REPORTS
ITEMNO.: 3 - |
CFILE LD - FINS10

DEPT:  SUCCESSOR RDA

REASON FOR CONSIDERATION: The City Council acting as successor to the Redevelopment "
Agency Board of Directors is requested to consider receiving and filing the Successor to the:
Redevelopment Agency Treasurer's Report for the month ending October 31, 2013,
pursuant to state law. . _

BACKGROUND: Included in your agenda packet is a copy of the Successor fo the -
Redevelopment Agency Treasurer's Report for the period ending October 31, 2013.

FISCAL IMPACT: Routine—report of the Agency's cash and investments. _
RECOMMENDATION: Staff recommends the City Council acting as successbr to th_é

Redevelopment Agency Board of Directors receive and file the Successor to the
Redevelopment Agency Treasurer's Report for the month ending October 31, 2013.

Fal

£ - e, Y

’ ) : Reviewed and

Prepared by: MJJMJ Approved by: W%M
Proofed by: @@M@ Presented by:/AUZ:‘V\ MJT\

20




 AGENDA REPORT

SUBJECT: C'_O-NSIDERVAPVPRO‘V‘AIV___OF WARRANT REGISTER 'DATE:  November 18, 2013 -
| o  SECTION: ADMIN.REPORTS
ITEM NO: 4
FILE LD FIN530
DEPT. - SUCCESSOR RDA

REASON FOR CONS'IDERATION:' The City Council aeting-as successor to the Redevelopment

 Ageéncy Board of Directors is requested to consider receiving and filing the Successor to the

Redevelopment Agency Warrant Reg:ster for the month ending October 31, 2013, pursuant
~ to state law. : :

'BACKGROUND Vlce Chalrman Ruh has examined the Successor to the Redevelopment
Agency Warrant Register dated 10.01.13-10.31.13 in the amounts of $1,416.52 for
~ Project I; $0.00 for Project Ii; $21,237.54 for Project l1l; $11,894.19 for Project IV;

. $19,247.18 for Project V; $0 00 for the Mission Boulevard Jomt Redevelopment Project;
$0.00 for the Redevelopment Obligation Retirement Funds; $52.50 from. the Tax Exempt
Bond Proceeds and $22 50 from the Taxable Bond Proceeds and finds it to be in order.

FISCAL IMPACT: Routme—report of Agency's obflgatlons.'
" RECOMMENDATION: Vice Chairman Ruh recommends the City Council as successor to

the Redevelopment Agency Board of Directors approve the Successor to the
Redevelopment Agency Warrant Register for the period ending October 31, 2013.

Fal

W{ & dg , Reviewed and
Prepared by: Approved by:
Proofed by: @VWW% Presented by:/

21




A-GE_NDA REPORT

SUBJECT: CONSIDER RECEIVING AND FILING OF . . DATE November 18, 2013 -
TREASURER'S REPORT - . | - o _
SECTION: " ADMIN. REPORTS
. ITEMNO. 5 |
CFILELD:  FIN525
DEPT: MHC

REASON FOR CONSIDERATION The Montclalr Housing Corporatlon Board of Directors is -
requested to receive and file the Montclair Housing Corporatson Treasurers Report for the
month endmg October 31, 201 3 pursuant to state Iaw

BACKGROUND: Inc!uded in your agenda packet isa copy of the Treasurer 5 Report for the
period ending October 31 201 3.

" FISCAL IMPACT: Routmewreport of the Montc!alr Housmg Corporatron s cash and invest-
ments. o o I

RECOMMENDATION: Staff recommends the Montclair Housmg Corporatlon Board of - ,
Directors receive and file the Treasurer's Report for the month ending October 31, 2013.

22 ~ o



AGENDA REPORT

SUBJECT: CONSIDER APPROVAL OF WARRANT REGISTER DATE: - November 18, 2013
| ' SECTION: ADMIN, REPORTS
ITEMNO. 6
 FILELD:  FIN54S
DEPT.i-V - MHC

REASON FOR CONSIDERATION: The Montclair Housing Corporatlon Board of Dlrectors
is requested to consider receiving and filing the Warrant Register for the month endmg
October 31, 20] 3, pursuant to state law. ' : :

BACKGROUND: Vice Chairman Ruh has exammed the Warrant Register dated 10. 01 13-
10.31.13 in the amount of $26,034.94 for the Montclair Housing Corporatson and fmds It
to be in order. '

FISCAL IMPACT: Routine—report of Montclair Housing Corpc_)ration's obliga_tions.

RECOMMENDATION:' Vice Chairman Ruh recommends the Montclair Ho'us'_ing Corporation -

Board of Directors approve the Warrant Register for the period ending October 31, 2013.

N
W Reviewed and
Prepared by: M%Lﬂé;/ Approved by: ( ey
Proofed by: QM&&&,M" Presented by: /A/U wh
7 / ot i :
23 : /




AGENDA REPORT

SUBJECT: . CONSIDER RECEIVING AND FILING OF 'DATE:  November 18, 2013
" TREASURER'S REPORT ' N .
_ B , SECTION:  ADMIN. REPORTS
CITEMNO: 7
FILE LD  FIN525

DEPT.: . MHA

" REASON FOR CONSIDERATION The Montclair Housing Authority Board of Directors is
requested to receive and file the Montclair Housing Authority Treasurers Report for the
month endmg October 31, 2013, pursuant to state law.

- -'BACKGROUND !ncluded in your agenda packet is a copy of the Treasurer's Report for the
period ending October 31, 2013, ~

FISCAL !MPACT Rout;ne—report of the Montclair Housmg Authorlty s cash and invest-
' ments

' RECOMMENDATION Staff recommends the Montclair Housmg Authority Board of
~ Directors receive and file the Treasurer's Report for the month ending October 31, 2013.

: /1 /N N
Prepared by: U Approved by: ( AL |-
Proofed by: @ML Presented by: % Eg;} § szj\\

24 ‘ /




AGENDA REPORT

" SUBJECT: CONSIDER APPROVAL OF WARRANT REGISTER ~ DATE:

- November 18, 2013

SECTION:

ITEM NO.:

FILE 1.D.:
' DEPT: '

ADMIN. REPORTS

g

FINS45 -
MHA

'REASON FOR CONSIDERAT!ON The Montclalr Housing Authérity Board of Dlrectors ‘
~ is requested to consider receiving and filing the Warrant Reglster for the month ending

- October 31, 201 3 pursuant 10 state law.

- '}'BACKGROUND Vice Chaurman Ruh has exammed the Warrant Register dated 10.01.13-
“10.31.13 in the amount of $0. 00 for the Montclair Housing Authority and finds it to be in

_ orcler

FISCAL IMPACT: Routmemreport of Montclalr Housmg Authorlty S obhgatlons

RECOMMENDATION Vice Cha;rman Ruh recommends the Montclalr Housing Authonty
Board of Directors approve the Warrant: Reglster for the period ending October 31, 201 3.

ya : :
/Z{, :é ,‘ /#M Reviewed and MM%‘/
Prepared by: / Approved by:

Proofed by: MM Presented by: /ZM )

25 e

e



 AGENDA REPORT

SUBJECT: CONSIDER AUTHORIZATION TO PURCHASE - DATE: November 18, 2013
: ONE 2013 HONDA CIVIC HYBRID SEDAN : e
FROM PENSKE HONDA ONTARIO SECTION:  ADMIN. REPORTS =~

| ' ITEM NO.: 9 e

FILELD.:  ENVO97/ENV325 -
 DEPT:  COMMUNITY DEV. -

- REASON FOR CONSIDERATION: The City Council is requested to-con'side'r__ authori'zin‘g‘ S
the purchase of a 2013 Honda Civic Hybrid Sedan pursuant to Purchasing Manual require- -

ments that expenditures in excess of $20,000 requirihg written bids be presented for City -~ -

Council consideration.

BACKGROUND: Because of recent audits and reviews of the South Coast Air'Quality M.a‘n'a_ge?.‘__

ment District (SCAQMD) AB 2766 Subvention Fund Program, staff has been encouraged to~

reduce the fund balance of the AB 2766 Program, which is approximately $123,237. The

requested vehicle purchase would replace the Code Enforcement vehicle (a 2005 Ford -
Taurus) that was totaled in an accident with an Omnitrans bus on January 31, 2013.

Consistent with staff’s endeavors over the past decade to add alternate fuel vehicles to
. the City's fleet to improve air quality, staff solicited written requests in-mid-August 20713
_for proposals from four local Honda deaters for a model year 2014 Honda Civic Hybrid. It
was subsequently communicated to staff by representatives from two of the dealers that
pricing information for 2014 Civics may not be available until December. Based on this
information, staff mailed revised written requests on September 24, 2013, to the same
four dealers requesting-a quote on a model year 2013 Honda Civic Hybrid, to which only
two dealers responded. Staff made a final effort to obtain a third bid by sending an elec-
tronic request on October 29, 2013, to ohe of the original nonresponsive dealerships and
a fifth dealership. Staff did not receive any responses to this final request to obtain a third
responsive bid. , : - :

The results of staff's bid:request for a 2013 Honda Civic HyBrid Sedan are as follows:

Vendor Cost
Penske Honda Ontario $24,664.28
Metro Honda $25,115.54
Norm Reeves Honda No response
Diamond Honda No response
Honda Cars of Corona No response
: s ,/ o
/%/ %%_\Reviewed and 7
Prepared by: fa) Approved by:

Proofed by: . Q_Q Presented by:

26




-FISCAL IMPACT The cost-to purchase a 2013 Honda Civic Hybrid Sedan from Penske
" Honda Ontario, the lowest responsive bidder, would be $24,664.28. This amount would
be borne entirely by SCAQMD AB 2766 Program funds. A total of $27,000 was approved
in the Fiscal Year 2013-14 Community Devélopment Department Budget for replacement
of the wrecked vehicle. Accordingly, there would be no impact to the City's General Fund

= assoaated with the requested hybrid vehlc!e purchase.

RECOMMENDAT!ON Staff recommends the City Council authorlze the purchase of one
- 2013 Honda Civic Hybrld Sedan from Penske Honda Ontario. _

27



AGENDA REPORT

SUBJECT: CONSIDER AUTHORIZATION OF A $9,500 DATE:  November 18, 2013
R APPROPRIATION FROM THE ECONOMIC 5 o
DEVELOPMENT FUND FOR SIGNAGE IMPROVE-  SECTION:  ADMIN. REPORTS
MENTS ASSOCIATED WITH THE CIVIC CENTER o -
SIGN PROJECT - ITEM NO: 10

FILELD:  CVCO60
DEPT.: - - PUBLIC WORKS_

" REASON FOR CONSIDERAT[ON The Csty Council is requested to con5|der authorlzmg
a $9,500 appropriation from the Economic Development Fund to replace signage around -
~ the Civic Center to improve building identification and be consistent Wlth other s:gnage
mstalled with recently completed buildings.

BACKGROUND: As part of the design work for the Youth Center and Senior Center ‘
projects, City staff introduced a new, more modern standard for building identification. ,
and wall-mounted signs. The new standard uses independent eight-inch bronzei—anodlzed '
letters that are wall-mounted with metal stud inserts. This type of sign can be seenon
both the Youth and Senior Center buildings. In total, six new signs are proposed to be:
installed, with one sign each at the Library, Community Center, Recreatlon Center and
Medical Clinic buildings and two signs at City Hall. '

- Staff has received three bid proposals for the project ranging from $8,675.50 to $13,200.
The proposals include removal of the existing signs and materials and labor for mstailatlon
of the new signs. This work would be done under a purchase order.

FISCAL IMPACT: Funding for the work is proposed to come from the Economic Develop-
ment Fund. The cost for installation of the Community Center signs is $8,675.50. Staff
also requests a construction contingency Qf $824.50.

RECOMMENDATION: Staff recommends the City Council appropriate $9, 500 from the
Economic Development Fund for signage improvements associated with the Civic Center
Sign Project. -

Reviewed and
Prepared by: Mﬁk/b Approved by:
Proofed by: Q LM Prasented by://,

28




 AGENDA REPORT

SUBJECT:  CONSIDER APPROVAL OF THE FILING " DATE:  November 18,2013

OF A NOTICE OF COMPLETION FOR THE

5444 PALO VERDE STREET ELECTRICAL = * SECTION: = ADMIN. REPORTS

IMPROVE ENT PR ' ST

: M OJECT JITEM NO: 11

. CONSIDER AUTHORIZ!NG RELEASE OF : . | :
RETENTION-30 DAYS AFTER RECORDA- ~ FILE 'TD'f' - MHco25
TION OF NOTICE OF COMPLETION . DEPT:  MHA

REASON" FOR CONSIDERATION State law requ1res Notlces of Completlon to be recorded
with the County Recordér upon acceptance of a public works project. The Montcialr Housing
.Corporation ‘Board of Directors is requested to consider approval of the filing of a Notice of

Completion with the Office of the San Bernardino County Recorder and release of retentlon
30 days after recordation of the Not;ce of. Compietlon for the 5444 Palo Verde Street
Electrical !mprovement Pro;ect h oL :

BACKGROUND The Montclalr Housing Corporation Board of Directors awarded Fulmin
Electrical Corporation a contract on Juhe 17, 2013, for the 5444 Palo Verde Street _
Electrical Improvement Project and entered into Agreement No. 13-34 with the company.
All work required under Agreement No. 13-34 has been satisfactorily competed. The
residence and studio's electrical upgrade is considered one of the major components

of the property's rehabilitation and included, but was not limited to, an upgrade of the

- electrical service panels; installation of new wiring; removal of |Ilegat electrical wiring,
receptacles, and switches; installation of ground fault circuit mterrupter receptacles; and
installation of new energy—efﬂcvent fixtures.

On August 19, 201 3, the MHC Board of Directors approved a request for an increase

of $18,500 in construction contingency because of unforeseen but necessary changes.

To recap, after discovering a false ceiling existed, it became necessary to remove ceiling
drywall to properly install the new light fixtures. Removal of portions of existing wall
material (T1-11 plywood) was required in some of the rooms so the wire could be installed
inside the walls rather than on the surface encased in wire mold. Staff discovered there
was no insulation in the ceilings or walls once the interior surfaces were removed and
determined this would be an appropriate time to install R-13 and R-19 insulation. Added
improvements also included new framing in some of the rooms, mstaHatlon of new drywall
and texture coat, and cable-readiness.

FISCAL IMPACT: The 5444 Palo Verde Street Electrical Improvement Project is included
in the MHC Fiscal Year 2013-14 Budget. The original contract amount was $51,927.
However, the final cost of the project totaled $72,781 with the increase in contingency
approved by the MHC Board of Directors on August 19, 2013.

Reviewed and
Prepared by: Approved by:

_Proofed by-: Presented by:

29



RECOMMENDATION Staff recommends the Montclair Housing Corporatlon Board of
" Directors take the following actions related to completlon of the 5444 Palo Verde Street
Electrtcal Improvement Pro;ect

1. Approve the fllmg of a Notice of Completion WIth the Offlce of the
San Bernardmo Cotinty Recorder. , ,

2. Authorize release of retention 30 days after recordatlon of Notlce of
' Completlon ,

30



RECORDING REQUESTED BY:
: Mon'tclair Housing Corporation

AND WHEN REGORDED MAIL DOCUMENT AND
TAX STATEMENT TO:
NAME: - Fabiola Lizaola

STREET ADDRESS: 5111 Benito Street

' SQS’E?TAT_E &zl Montclair, CA 91763

Government Code 6103

(Space above this line for Recorder's Use Gnly)

NOTICE OF COMPLETION

NOTICE is hereby given that: The undersagned is the owner of an interest of estate in the
heremaﬁer described property, the nature of which sald interest or estate is:

fee

Christine S. Caldwell
Assistant Director of Housing
5111 Benito Street
Montclair, CA 91763

The work was completed on that certain work known as:

The full name and address of the undersigned is

5444 Palo Verde St. Electrical Improvement Project

for the undersigned City of Montclar, -

a Municipal Corporation, on the 6th day of ‘November, 2013

The City accepted the job onthe 24th day of June, 2013

, Aaron Mayoral — Fulmin Electrical Corp.
The Contractor on said job was 945 W. Berkeley Crt.
Ontario, CA 91762

The improvement consisted of:
Electrical improvements and upgrades to a single-family residence owned and operated by the
Montclair Housing Corporation.

The property upon which said work of improvement was completed is described as:
5444 Palo Verde St. Montclair, CA 81763 / 1008-383-16

VERIFICATION
}, the undersigned, say that | am agent for the owner of the aforesaid interest or estate in the
property described in the above notice. | have read the foregoing notice and know and understand
the contents thereof, and the facts stated herein are true and correct.

1 declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

Executed on: at 5111 Benito Street, Montclair, California

Christine S. Caldwell, Assistant Director of
Housing

t
Notice of Completion_electisal (2)

31




AGENDA REPORT

© SUBJECT: - CONSIDER AUTHORIZATION TO PURCHASE  DATE:  November 18, 2013

ONE 2014 CHEVROLET 2500HD PICKUP o s ,
TRUCK - ' ‘ - ~ SECTION:  ADMIN REPORTS
o ' | ITEM'NO: 12 |

" FILELD. ~ VEH450
DEPT:  PUBLIC WORKS

'REASON FOR CONSIDERATION: Expenditures in excess of $20,000 require City. Council
authorization. o . . .

BACKGROUND: The Public Works Fiscal Year 2013-14 Budget includes an appropriation
for the purchase of a Chevrolet 2500HD pickup truck to be assigned to the Parks Division
as a replacement for the Parks Division's Unit No. 215. Staff requested bids from three
local auto dealerships for the truck. Following are the bid results: '

Verdor - C‘ost-

MK Smith Chevrolet T $24.248.16
Rotolo Chevrolet - |- $24,888.50

Mountain View Chevrolet | $25,914.60

FISCAL IMPACT: - The cost to purchase one Chevrolet 2500HD pickup truck from MK Smith
Chevrolet is $24,248.16. There would be an additional cost for safety lighting that would
be installed after the vehicle is purchased. In total, the cost of the vehicle and safety
lighting would be well under the $40,200 amount approved in the Budget.

'RECOMMENDATION: Staff recommends the City Council authorize staff to purchase one
12014 Chevrolet 2500HD pickup truck. '

' o Reviewed and
Prepared %M/ AE\SSC\:\IJZd a;)r\z(:
Proofed by: C Q_,,Qj/ \/\?\ Presented by:

32




AGENDA REPORT

" 'SUBJECT: CONSIDER APPROVAL OF AGREEMENT | DATE: - November 18, 20:1'3

NO. 13-91-1-89, AN IRREVOCABLE : L
ANNEXATION AGREEMENT WITH JOSEY ~  SECTION:  AGREEMENTS
CHAVEZ FOR 4743 HOWARD STREET R
(APN 1012-331-05) ' : ITEM NO.. 1

- FILE LD~ SEWO.BO ;

' .DEPT:  COMMUNITY DEV.

REASON FOR CONSIDERATION: Irrevocabie Annexation Agreements are subject to
City Council review and consrderatlon S ,

- BACKGROUND: Proposed Irrevocable Annexatlon Agreement No. 13- 91 I- 89 would
permit the property owner of the subject parcel located in unincorporated County
territory to connect to the City's sewer main in Howard Street, with the Agreement
requiring annexation of the property when feasible at a future date. '

if approved by the City Council, the Agreement would also be subject to approval by
the Laocal Agency Formation Commission (LAFCO). The proposed Agreement and
sewer connection request are consistent with City policy and meet all applicable -
City requirements. Following City Council and LAFCO approvals, the Agreement is
recorded against the property and becomes binding on future owners, helrs

- successors, and assigns.

FISCAL IMPACT: There would be no fiscal impact associated with execution of
Irrevocable Annexation Agreement No. 13-91-1-89.

RECOMMENDATIO_N: Staff recommends the City Council approve Agreement.
No. 13-91-1-89, an Irrevocable Annexation Agreement with Josey Chavez for
the property at 4743 Howard Street (Assessor's Parcel No. 1012-331-05).

W@ Reviewed and
Prepared by: : Approved by:
Proofed by: ﬁﬂ&/& @\D/UH( Presented by/

33 /




AGREEMENT NO. 13-91 -1-89

AN IRREVOCABLE AGREEMENT TO ANNEX
TO THE CITY OF MONTCLAIR

(Josey Chavez,-4?,43 Howard Street)

~ This - agreement is entered into this 18th. day of November, 2013, between
Josey Chavez, a married woman as her sole and separate property, heremafter referred
to as "Owner," and the City of Montclair, hereinafter referred to as "City."

WHEREAS Owner is the legal property owner of the real property located at
4743 Howard Street, also referenced as San Bernardino County Tax Assessor Parcel
No. (APN) 1012 331-05, shown as Exhibit "A" attached, and is further described as
follows:

Lot 5 of Tract 4474 as per Map recorded in Book 63 Pages 70 {o 72 of
Maps, in the Office of the County Recorder of said County.

Commonly known as 4743 Howard Street, Montclair, CA 91763.

WHEREAS, the subject property is a 7,200 square-foot (0.16 acres) lot on the
south side of Howard Street, within the unlncorporated San Bernardino County area that
is a part of the Sphere of Influence of the City of Montclair; and -

WHEREAS, the subject propenrty is deveioped with a single-family residence and
~ detached garage constructed in 1961 (per assessor's records); and :

: WHEREAS, the Owner desires to connect to and utilize the City's sanitary sewer
system for the -above-described property, said system otherwise being available only to
properties within the City of Montclair corporate limits; and

WHEREAS, Owner desires to annex to the City of Montclair; and

WHEREAS, the City is willing to consent to the connection of said property to the
sewer main only on the condition that the property be annexed to the City at the earliest
possible time; and

WHEREAS, the City intends to pursue annexation of Owner's property plus other
property, but said annexation will cause delay, which would create a substantial

hardship for Owner of said property; and

Annexation Agreement No. 13-91-1-89 34 Page 1



~ WHEREAS, the agréements, conditions, and covenants contained herein are .

made for the direct benefit of the land subject to this Agreement and described herein

and shall create an equitable servitude upon the land and operate as a covenant

~ running with the land for the benefit of the Owner of the land and his héirs, successors,
~ and assigns. K . . o

- NOW THEREFORE, the parties do a'gre'e"aé follows:

— 1. - Owner does hereby give :irrevbcable'c‘:o'ns'ent“ to annex to the City of
* Montclair at stich time as the annexation may be properly approved through appropriate -

legal proceedings, and Owner does further agree to provide all reasenable cooperation
and assistance to the City in the annexation proceedings. ‘Said cooperation -is
_contemplated to include signing any applications of consent prepared by the City, and
submitting any evidence reasonably within the control of the Owner to. the various
hearings required for the annexation. Said cooperation does not include, however, any

~ obligation. on behaif of the Owner to-institute any Iitiga’ti_c),n of judicial proceeding -

whatsoever to force annexation to the City.

© 2. The City of Mont¢lair does hereby agree to authorize the connection of
said property, proposed to be developed on Owner's property, to the sewer main

. located in Howard Street. Said connection to the sewer main shall be permitted by the
City at such time as all applicable ‘permits have been obtained and associated fees-

have been paid.

_ 3. Owner agrees to pay such annexation fees and costs, and other municipal
charges as would ordinarily be charged in the annexation of property to the City. Said
fees shall be payable when the same becomes due ‘and payable. (In some
circumstances, these fees may be borne by the City.).

4. Owner shall pay all fees and charges and make all deposits required by

“the City to connect to and use the sewer, and Owner agrees to be bound by all City

ordinances, rules, and regulations with respect to the sewer system. Owner agrees fo

pay monthly sewer charges beginning on the date this agreement is approved by the
City Council. -

5. This agreement shall be recorded with the Office of the Recorder of the
County of San Bernardino.

6.  Owner shall install any a'nd all future improvements upon .said property to
the City's standards, except that the County standard(s) shall apply when more
restrictive than the City standard(s).

7. Owner shall execute this agreement on behalf of himself, his heirs,

successors, and assigns, and said agreement shall be irrevocable without the prior

“written consent of both parties hereto.

Annexation Agreement No. 13-91-1-89 _ Page 2
35



| 8. The benefit to the sub]ect property shall inure to the benefit of subsequent |
‘owners, their heirs, successors, and assigns; and the agreements conditions, and
‘covenants contarned herem shall be binding upon them and upon the land.

. IN WITNESS WHEREOF the partles hereto have caused thls Agreement to be :
' executed the day and year first above written. ' '

oy N OWNER'

'CITY OF MONTCLAIR, CALIFORNIA ' JOSEY CHAVEZ, a mariied woman as
" : T o her sole and separate property

. PaulM. Eaton © B B - - ,.'Josey Chavez
- Mayor- T i

ATTEST:

Yvonne L. Smith.
Deputy City Clerk

‘Date

' APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Diane E. Robbins
City Attorney

Annexation Agreement No. 13-91-1-89 Page 3
' 36



EXHIBIT "A"

, \ VICINITY MAP , o
lrrevocable Annexation Agreement No 13-91 -l 89 -
Josey Chavez 4743 Howard Street

: f _—"f | SUBJECT PROPERTY |
— 747_43 Howard' Street |
|_(APN 1012-331-05) |-

-~ . Howard Street T




EXHIBlT “B" f o

UTILITY PLAN

| Irrevoceble Annexat:on Agreement No. 13-91 1-89 :

Josey Chavez 4743 Howard Street o

o PUBLIC T Hou{mwo %TQFF(‘ _sTwEn '

- 38

Z >



AGENDA REPORT

SUBJECT: CONSIDER ADOPTION-OF RESOLUTION - DATE: November.18, 2013
' NO. 13-3015 SETTING A PUBLIC HEARING j e
~ FORJANUARY 20,2014, RELATED TOA = SECTION: RESOLUTIONS
" PROPOSED FIVE-YEAR SCHEDULE OF = - - o S
" MAXIMUM MONTHLY RATE CAPS FOR . IMTEMNO. 1~

RESIDENTIAL AND COMMERCIAL REFUSE . oo o oo o
SERVICES PURSUANT TO PROPOSITION 218~ FILE LD REF285 ‘
_ NOTIFICATION, PROTEST, AND PUBLIC CmEpre Al |
- HEARING PROCESS AND DIRECTING THAT DEPT: . ADMIN. SVCS.
* NOTICE THERETO BE PROVIDED TO
- PROPERTY OWNERS OF RECORD UPON .
WHICH PROPOSED FEES WOULD BE IMPOSED

CONSIDER AUTHORIZING STAFF TO SEND
NOTICES TO PROPERTY OWNERS REGARD-
© ING A WORKSHOP AND PUBLIC HEARING
TO CONSIDER ESTABLISHING MAXIMUM = .
MONTHLY RESIDENTIAL AND COMMERCIAL
RATE CAPS FOR REFUSE-SERVICES PURSUANT
- TO PROPOSITION 218 REQUIREMENTS

CONSIDER ALLOCATING UP TO $12,000 _
FROM THE CONTINGENCY FUND TO MAIL °
NOTICES OF A PROPOSITION 218 PUBLIC
HEARING TO PROPERTY OWNERS REGARD-
NG ESTABLISHING A FIVE-YEAR SCHEDULE
OF MAXIMUM MONTHLY RATE CAPS FOR -
RESIDENTIAL AND COMMERCIAL REFUSE
SERVICES '

REASON FOR CONSIDERATION: The City of Montclair provides a number of property-
related services to residents and property owners within the City's administrative boundaries
including greenwaste, recycling, and refuse services—collectively referred to herein as refuse
services. The cost of prowdlng refuse disposal services is charged directly to residents and
property owners.

Pursuant to Section 6.16.050 of Title 6 of the Montclair Municipal Code, the City Council
may, from time to time, consider adjustments to rates for solid waste disposal services;
however, in compliance with Proposition 218 (1996), rate adjustments cannot exceed estab-
lished maximum rate caps unless and until such rates caps are increased pursuant to the
public notification and hearing process as required by Proposition 218. The City Council
authorizes Proposition 218 public notifications and hearings for property-related fee
adjustments, and establishes fee caps related thereto.

Prepared by: 4

Proofed by:

39




Burrtec Waste Industries, the City's franchise refuse hauler, is requestmg rate increases
for residential and commercual accounts. In order to proper[y consider refuse rate”
increases, the City Council must first provide notlﬁcatlons ahd conduct hearmgs
‘pursuant to Proposition 21 8 :

BACKGROUND: Burrtec Waste Industrles Inc. (Burrtec) the City's franch:se sol:d waste
hauler, is seeking an adjustmernit to residential and commercial refuse rates. Proposed
rate adJustments include new fees for recycling and sanitation to comply with state law
mandates, provide enhanced service levels to the community, establish a new multifamily
commercial rate and prov:de commercial operators Wlth a range of optlonai ser\nces

Proposition 218 Hearmg Reqmrement

In order to proceed with rate adjustments for residential and commarcial refuse services,. .
the City is required to conduct a Proposition 218 hearing to ‘establish a five-year period

" of maximum rate caps. The requirement to conduct a Proposition 218 public hearing on
refuse rates was confirmed on July 24, 2006, when the California Supreme Court published
its decision in Bighorn-Desert View Water Agency v. Beringson, addressing the property- -
related fee provisions of Proposition 218. In its decision, the Court ruled that when a rate -
is set by a government agency, it is a "property-related” fee subject to the public hearing
requirements of Proposition 218. A Proposition 218 public hearing on refuse rates was
last held on Aprit 16, 2007. At that time, the City Council approved a ten- year schedule ,
of maximum rate caps for refuse serwces—June 1, 2007 through June 30 201 7.

Government Code Section 53756

" In addition to complying with the Proposition 218 public hearing process, municipal
agencies are required to comply with Government Code Section 53756, which provides -
that an agency providing... refuse collection service may adopt a schedule of fees or
charges authorizing automatic adjustments that pass through increases...if it comp//es
with all of the following:.

a. Adopts the schedule of fees or charges for a property-related service for a perlod not
to exceed five years.

b. The schedule of fees may include a schedule of adjustment, including a clearly
defined formula for adjusting for inflation, not to exceed the cost of prowdlng that
service. :

c. Notice of any adjustment pursuant to the schedule shall be given not less than
30 days before the effective date of the adjustment.

Government Code Section 53756 was chaptered into law on July 13, 2012, approximately
five years after the City Council conducted its Aprlt 16, 2007 Proposition 218 public
hearing on refuse service rates.

Proposition 218 Public Hearing Process
Article XD, Section 6(a) of the State Constitution (Proposition 218-1996), passed by the

voters of California on November 5, 1996, requires municipalities to give detailed written
notice to the owners of parcels upon which proposed fees or charges are to be applied.

40



a. _' A pubhc hearlng shail be conducted not iess than 45 days after ma:[mg of the notice.

- b. If written protests against a proposed fee or. charge are presented by a majority of
- owners of the parcels the fee adjustment shall not be tmpiemented :

c. Ifa majorlty protest. is not received, the rate cap shall go into effect W|thout further
' action. : :

d. Written protests can be prowded to the Clty in advance of the date set for a publlc
hearing:

"The date recommended for the pubhc hearlng before the Czty Councnl is January 20, 201 4

at 7:00 p.m. in the Montclair City Council Chambers. A workshop in which property owners
~could inquire regarding proposed refuse rate caps is scheduled for Tuesday, January 7, 2014
at 6:00 p.m., in the Montclair City Council Chambers. City staff and representatives from
Burrtec will be available at both the workshop and public hearing to respond to property
“owners' questlons

Residential Rates

-On April 16, 2007, pursuant to-provisions of Proposition 218, the City Council adopted .
Resolution No. 07-2681, establishing a ten-year schedule of maximum residential refuse
service rates for the period June 1,-2007 through June 30, 2017. However, on july 13,

2012, AB 2567 was chaptered mto faw as Government Code Section 53756, prohibiting
automat:c adjustments for property-related fees for a period not to exceed five years. _
Accordingly, on and after July 13, 2012, the City of Montclair would be required to conduct -
a Proposition 218 public hearing before adopting any increase to monthly refuse service
rates. Furthermore, any schedule of maximum refuse service rates authorizing automatic
adjustments that pass through increases cannot exceed a period of five years.

‘Agreement No. 13~71, by and between Burrtec Waste Industries (Burrtec) and the City of
Montclair, provides for the annual adjustment of residential refuse service rates by a

percentage increase notto exceed the A/ Cities Consumer Price Index (CPl) for the Los

Angeles-Riverside-Orange Co. Area, All-ltems Indexes, Al Urban Consumers, for the
previous 12 months endmg in January.

Burrtec last requested and received a 5.0 percent residential refuse service rate
adjustment in April 2009, with an effective date of June 1, 2009. Pursuant to the terms
and conditions of Agreement No. 13-71, Burrtec is technically eligible for an increase of
7.6 percent—the cumulative CPi for January 2009 (-0.1 percent); fanuary 2010 (1.8
percent); January 2011 (1.8 percent); january 2012 (2.1 percent); and january 2013 (2.0
percent). :

Burrtec is requesting a 4.89 percent rate adjustment with an effective date on or about
February 1, 2014. Accordingly, the City Council is requested to:

1. Consider adopting Resolution No. 13-3015 setting a public hearing to consider
establishing a proposed maximum five-year schedule of rates for residential refuse
services.

2. Authorize noticing property owners of a Proposition 218 public hearing for Tuesday,
January 20, 2014,

41



. Resrdentml Refuse Rate: Five- Year Schedule of Maxrmum Rate Caps

The proposed five-year schedu[e of rates is based on the terms and conditions contamed
- in Agreement No. 13-71. The first three years of the proposed five-year schedule reflect
- the same maximum rate caps established by the City Council durmg the April 16, 2007,
publ:c hearmg for the same three- year perlod : : _

: Table 1, below reﬂects the proposed schedule of maximum refuse rates that can be

. .‘assessed to resrdentlal rate payers for the five-year rate period that runs from February 1,

2014 through January 1, 2019. At no time- during each of the annual rate periods can

- refuse rates exceed the appl;cable maximum monthly rate cap for the effective year. Ifa
request for refuse rate increases exceeds the effective maximum monthly rate cap for the
E appllcable year, a new. Proposition 21 8 public hearlng would be reqmred

Proposed maxrmum res:dentlai refuse rate caps are bhased on a flve percent per annum
adjustment pursuant to Agreement No. 13-71.

. Maxrmum resrdentlal refuse rate caps are not an mdlcatzon of actual monthly res;dentral
refuse rates.

‘The Clty of Montclair typically i mcreases res:dentlai refuse rates once every three to five

- years; and rate increases for the cumulative period are typically at or below 5 percent—
~well below maximum refuse rate caps, and well below authorrzed increases pursuant to
' Agreement No. 13-71. ' : :

‘Table 1

7 Maximum Proposed Monthly Residential Refuse Rate Caps'

Proposed Maximum Residential Rate Caps
. Fffective Dates .
Service Current .| February 1, } January I, Jfanuary 1, January 1, Januvary 1,
Rate’ 2014 2015 2016 2017 2018
Manthly : i ' T
Residentfal $25.36 $26.88 $28.22 $29.63 $32.00° $33.60
Refuse Rate ' .
Birt ; ' ;
1.5 /Frequency 1 $71.19 . $93.80 $98.49 $103.41 $108‘.58 $114.0

Proposed Residential Re’fuse. Rates Effective February 1, 2014

Concurrent with the request to conduct a Proposition 218 public hearing on January 20,
2014 to consider establishing a five-year schedule of maximum residential refuse rate

- caps, City staff anticipates asking Council to consider a proposed schedule of residential
refuse rates effective on or about February 1, 2014. Burrtec is requesting a residential
refuse rate adjustment of 4.89 percent, pursuant to Agreement No. 13-71.

For information purposes only as this is to be considered in a separate public

hearing: Following is a discussion of components that constitute the monthly residential
refuse rate and proposed cost adjustments for each rate component:

42



Refuse Service Rate: The refuse service rate represents that portion of the rate paid

~ to Burrtec for collecting and transporting refuse to the Materials Recovery Facility -

(MRF). The City's Agreement with Burftec allows the refuse service rate to be

- adjusted each year by the CPl,-not to exceed 5 percent annually. Burrtec is
‘requesting a service rate acijustment of $0 50 (4 89 percent), from $10.32 to $1O 82.

Landfill Rate: The landflll rate represents a pass through of actual transportatlon

and tipping fees paid by Burrtec. Currently, refuse generated in Montclair is
transported from Burrtec's MRF in Fontana to several landfills within Burrtec's
network of landfill disposal sites throughout Southern California. The rate is L

" adjusted by d formula agreed upon in Agreement No..13-71. There is no anticipated

- increase in the tipping fee; however, the costto pick up and transport refuse te
landfills has increased significantly; partly because of high diesel fuel prices. Burrtec -
is requesting a modest $0.23 adjustment in the Iandﬁll rate from $3.87 to $4.10.

Recyc/fng Service Rate: The 'recycling_ service rat‘e repre‘se'nt_s th_e.cost of ,colEecting '
and transporting recyclables to the MRF. The rate is adjusted by a formula agreed.
upon in Agreement No. 13-71. A recyclmg service rate acIJustment of- $O 16 from

- $3.19t0 $3.35, s bemg proposed. : :

Materials Recovery Facility Fee.' ‘The MRF component is affected by (1) the volume of
recyclables processed; (2) the amount of refuse (contamination) found in the '
recyclables; and (3) the market value of recycled commodltles over the precedmg

12 months. ‘

Pursuant to AB 341 all cities |n the state must reach azs percent landfill recovery
rate by 2020. As such the amount of recyclable commodities that Burrtec is able to
collect and process has increased significantly as a result of state law. The recent
growth in the volume of recyclables has produced a downward trend in commodity
prices. At the same time, the amount of material that Burrtec is able to process and
redistribute to third parties for use in the manufacturing of goods has climbed
dramatically, resulting in a net profit for Burrtec. Accordingly, and pursuant to terms
agreed to in Agreement No. 13-71, Burrtec is proposing a credit of $0.42 per month
to residential ratepayers—in contrast, Burrtec currently assesses a $0.9 processing
fee. : .

During negotiations, Burrtec suggested creating a fund from the proposed Materials
Recovery Facility Fee credit to reimburse the City for the cost of general community
maintenance—currently, a portion of general community maintenance is paid for by
the General Sanitation Fee, adopted by the City Council in 2011. However, in the
interest of limiting refuse service costs to residents, City staff recommends the
Materials Recovery Facility Fee credit be passed onto the ratepayer.

Greenwaste Disposal: The Greenwaste Disposal Fee represents a pass-through of
actual transportation and tipping fees paid by Burrtec. The Greenwaste Disposal Fee
has increased from $28 per ton to $35.61 per ton. Increases for this rate compo-
nent are typically tied to increases in fuel prices and tipping fees, and decreases in
commodity volume. Currently, the average household in Montclair is generating
3,905 tons of greenwaste per year, up from 3,490 ton four years ago. An increase in
commodity volume would generally result in a corresponding decrease in the cost of

43



~ disposal. However the opportunlty for a decrease has been offset by S|gn|f1cant
increases in transportation and tlppmg fee costs.

The formula used to calculate the greenwaste component is essentially based on
disposal volume plus the disposal charge per ton. As indicated, the volume of
greenwaste per household increased significantly; however, increases in fuel costs
and disposal tlpplng rates combined to produce a proposed $0.96 mcrease in this
cost component up from $0. 8! to $1.77.

- Househo/d Hazardous Waste Fee: The City is in ‘the 21" year of an agreement with
- the County of San Bernardino to provide household hazardous waste disposal
_ facrllttes : ‘

Dlsposal fa-c_-ilrities are located at the foEIoWing Iocationé: _
5050 Schaefer A\(en'ue, Chino
1408 East Francis Street, Ontario
1370 North Benson Avenue, Upland

Montclaw residents may dispose of hazardous waste at no charge at the time of
disposal, and are annually assessed approximately $5.39 per household ($0.45 ,
-monthly). The Household Hazardous Waste Fee is based on the actua! cost charged.

* to the City by San Bernardino County, and is intended as a pass-through cost to each
ratepayer. There is no adjustment in the Household Hazardous Waste Fee component
for Fiscal Year 2013-14; and any rate increase for Fiscal Year 2014-15 is unknown at
this time.

General Sanitation Fee: The general sanitation fee is a rate component assessed to -
residential ratepayers to reimburse for a portion the City costs related to general
community maintenance issues including graffiti abatement, alleyway maintenance, -
illegal dumping, property cleanup, sanitation services, and removal of abandoned
bulky items in neighborhoods and alleyways. Since adoption of the General Sanita-
tion Fee in 2011, the service charge has remained below the actual/estimated cost of
service. There is no anticipated adjustment in the General Sanitation Fee component
for Fiscal Year 2013-14: nor is a fee adjustment anticipated for Fiscal Year 2014-1 5
The current monthly assessment per household is $2.82.

Administrative Fee: The Administrative Fee is a charge imposed by the City to
reimburse for the cost of administering the refuse service program—the current fee
is $3.99 per month. Service charges should approximate the actual/estimated cost

 of service. There is no anticipated adjustment in the General Sanitation Fee compo-

nent for Fiscal Year 2013-14; nor is a fee adjustment anticipated for Fiscal Year
2014-15.

Table 1 on the following page identifies cost components of Montclair's Total Monthly
Household Refuse Rate including current and proposed rates—proposed monthly residen-
tial refuse rates will be considered at a public hearing scheduled for January 20, 2014.

Table 1 also indicates that adoption of proposed Resolution No. 13-3015 would increase
the Total Monthly Household Refuse Rate from $25.36 to $26.88, an increase of $1.52.

44



Senior households would continue to be charged a refuse rate that is 20‘percent below the
‘monttily refuse fee for nonsenior households—the monthly senior household rate would
“increase from $20 29 to $21.50, an increase of $1.21.

, Table 1
Total Monthly Household Refuse Rate Components
Current and Proposed, Residential Refuse Rates

Fee Components B Current Proposed
Refuse service rate $. 10.32 $ 10.82 -
- Recycling service rate - $ . 319 $§ 335
Refuse iandflll/Transfer rate $ 3.89 3 4.10
MRF fees $ 0.09 (=042
Greenwast dlspos rate - $ . 0.81 5 77
Total cost paid: ta Burrtec - . $ 1810 %
. Generaisanitation,fe’e : 3 2.82 ) 2.82
- Administrative fee $ 3.99 $ -3.99
Household Hazardous Waste fee § 045 $ 0.45
Total month i § R
- “collection:

Monthiy City supSIdy per senior B 5.07 $

household 5.38
Miscellaneous: : :
Multifamily bin $ 311 B S A i |
Extra Cart: Refuse/Recycling/ $5.50/%1.25/  $5.50/%1.25/
Greenwaste , 3 3.50 $ 3.50
Large item collection: Monthly Burrtec
charge—all City households; cost $2,400.00 $3,250.00

incorporated in administrative fee

Senior HouSehold Refuse Raté Subsidy Program

For Information Purposes only as this is to be considered in a separate public
hearing: Montclair currently provides a monthly refuse rate subsidy program for senior
households—to qualify, accountholders must be age 65 or older, live at the residence,
and the refuse account must be in the customer's name. The current monthly household
refuse rate for senior households is $20.29— a savings of $5.07 off the current Total
Monthly Household Refuse Rate of $25.36; the proposed Senior Household rate of $21.50
effective on or about February 1, 2014, represents a savings. of $5.38 below the proposed
Total Monthly Household Refuse Rate of $26.88.

Continuation of a discount program for senior households was discussed at the November
21, 2005 meeting of the City Council— the City Council considered alternatives related to
discounting refuse service rates and ultimately approved maintaining a 20 percent discount
off the Total Monthly Household Refuse Rate until funds in the Refuse Impound Reserve
Fund are depleted.

45



The subsrdy program is not a rate dlscount off the Total Monthly Household Refuse Rate
“rather, it is a General Fund subsidy that offsets the Total Monthly Household Refuse Rate
currently charged to the households of nonsenior residential refuse ratepayers. The
" General Fund subsidy is used to make full payment to Burrtec for refuse services prowded '
to senior households - :

The Fmance Department has: determlned that the General Fund réfuse rate sub5|dy for
senior households can continue through Fiscal Year 2014 15. before funds in the sub5|dy
account are depleted S , .

Recognlzmg that the City CounCII is rightly concerned W|th the cost of refuse services for
households on limited income, continuing a refuse-rate.subsidy program for senior house- -
- holds may continue to be an appropriate course of action. To achieve this objective, the

- City Council, at.its January 20, 2014, public hearing on proposed residential refuse rates,

* may consider maintaining the current 20 percent subsidy or direct City staff to reduce the
sub5|dy to a lesser amount—rang:ng from 2.5 percent to 17.5 percent

However, in keepmg W|th dlrect:on from the Novembear 21, 2005 Clty Counal meetmg,
current intent is to migrate senior households to the standard monthly residential refuse
rate. :

It is apparent that passing on the full cost for refuse services to senior households
effective July 1, 2015, would result in a significant monthly increase--$5.38 based on the
proposed monthly refuse rate currently under consideration. Instead, the City Council
may elect to consider migrating senior households to the standard household refuse rate
'over the course of several years.

> Staff recommends continuing the practice of providing a 20 percent discount off the
monthly residential refuse rate for senior households through the remainder of Fiscal
Year 2013-14. Thereafter, beginning with Fiscal Year 2014-15, Council may direct
staff to reduce the 20 percent discount for senior household as follows

v Flsca[ Year 2014-15—reduce senior househo_ld refuse rate sub5|dy to 15 percent
_effective July 1, 2014

¥ Fiscal Year 201 5 16—reduce senior household refuse rate sub5|dy to 10 percent
effectweJuly 1, 2015 :

v Fiscal Year 2016-17, reduce senior household refuse rate subsidy to 5 percent
effective July 1, 2016

v' Fiscal Year 2017-18—eliminate senior household refuse rate subsidy effective July
1,2017

>  As an alternative to the proposed reduction to the senior household rate as indicated
above, City Council may consider a more gradual reduction, as follows:

v Fiscal Year 2014-15—reduce senior household refuse rate subsidy to 17.5 percent
effective July 1, 2014

v" Fiscal Year 2015- lG—reduce senior household refuse rate subSIdy to 15 percent
effective july 1, 2015

46



v Fiscal Year 2016-17—reduce senior household refuse rate sub5|dy to ]2 5 percent
- effective July 1, 2016 .

v Fiscal Year 2017- t8—reduce senior household refuse rate subsrdy to 10 percent
effective july 1 2017

v Fiscal Year 2018-19—reduce senior household refuse rate sub5|dy to 8 5 percent
: effect:vejuly 1,2018

v Fiscal Year 2019- 20—reduce senior household refuse rate sub3|dy to 5 percent
effectlveJu!y 1,2019 : : .

v Fiscal Year 2020- 21—reduce senior household refuse rate subsrdy to 2. 5 percent
-effective july'1, 2020 .

v" Fiscal Year 2021-22— eliminate senior. househo!d refuse rate sub5|dy effectlvejuly
1, 2021 : .

If it is City Council's intent to maintain a senior household refuse rate subsrdy program
but at a lesser percentage, City staff recommends the City Council determine what the
new subsidy rate would be and decrease it gradually by using one of the two reduction
schedules recommended above. o :

Council Members are advised that in addition to a gradual reduction in the refuse rate
-discount, senior households would continue to be impacted by any increase in the
standard household refuse rate, subject to the applicable subsidy rate in effect at time of
implementation. Continuing the refuse rate subsidy program for senior households, as
defined herein, would require an ongoing transfer of funds from the General Fund to the
General Fund Subsidy Account for senior household refuse rate payers.

Commercial Rates

Similar to the discussion for residential refuse rates, it is the City Attorney's opinion that
Proposition 218 requires a public hearing for commercial refuse rates. However, unlike
residential refuse rates that were subject to a Proposition 218 public hearing on April 16,
2007, this current effort related to commercial refuse rates’is the City's first in relation to
conductmg a Proposition 218 public hearing.

The process related to conducting a Proposition 218 public hearing for commercial refuse
rates is similar to the process followed for residential refuse rates. A Proposition 218

public hearing on commercial refuse rates is now triggered in relation to Burrtec's request
to adjust commercial refuse rates. '

Agreement No. 13-71 provides for annual adjustment of commercial refuse service rates
by a percentage increase not to exceed the A// Cities Consumer Price Index (CPl) for the

Los Angeles-Riverside-Orange County Area, All-Items Indexes, All Urban Consumers for
the previous 12 months ending in January.

Burrtec last requested and received a 3.5 percent commercial refuse service rate adjust-
ment in June 2008 with an effective date of July T, 2008. Pursuant to the terms and
conditions of Agreement No. 13-71, Burrtec is technically eligible for an increase of
11.5 percent—the cumulative CPI for January 2008 (3.9 percent); January 2009

47



(-0.1 percent) January 2010 {1.8 percent); January 20]1 (1. 8 percent) January 2012
(2.1 percent); and January 2013 (2.0). :

 Burrtec is requestmg a3.60 percent rate adjustment for Roll-Off Commercial Rates
“effective on or about February 1, 2014, and waives CPl-adjustments for all other
_ commerclal rates. Accordmgly, the Clty Council is requested to:

1. Consider adoptlng Resolution No. 13- 3015 setting a public-hearing to consider
o establlshmg a proposed maximum five-year schedule of rates for commercial refuse
services. :

2. Authorize notlcmg property owners of a Proposrtlon 218 public hearlng for Tuesday,
©January 20, 2014 ,

_Commercml_ Refuse Rate:, Five-Year Schedule of Maximum Rate Caps

The proposed five-year schedule of commercial rates is based on the terms and
- conditions contained in Agreement No. 13-71. .

Table 2, attached as Appendix 1, reflects the proposed schedule of maximum refuse -
rates that can be assessed to commercial rate payers for the five-year period that runs
from February 1, 2014 through January 1, 2019. At no time during each of the annual
rate periods can commercial refuse rates exceed the applicable maximum monthly rate
cap for the effective year. If a request for commercial rate increases exceeds the effective
‘maximum monthly rate cap for the applicable year, a new Proposition 218 public hearlng
‘would be'required.

Proposed maximum commercial refuse rate caps are based on a five percent per annum
adJustment pursuant to Agreement No. 13-71.

Maximum commercial refuse rate caps are not an indication of actual monthly commercial

_refuse rates. The City of Montclair typically increases refuse rates once every three to five

years; and rate increases for the cumulative period are typically at or below 5 percent—
well below maximum refuse rate caps, and well below authorized increases pursuant to
Agreement No. 13-71.

Concurrent with the request to conduct a Proposition 218 public hearing on January 20,
2014 to consider establishing maximum commercial refuse rate caps, City staff will
request Council consideration of a proposed schedule of commercial refuse rates effective
on or about February 1, 2014. Burrtec is requesting a commercial refuse rate adjustment
of 3.60 percent, pursuant to Agreement No. 13~71.

For information purposes only as this is to be considered in a separate public
hearing: Following is a discussion of components that constitute the monthly commercial
refuse rate and proposed cost adjustments for each rate component.

. Service costs related to the provision of refuse services. Service costs are subject to
annual CPl adjustments pursuant to Agreement No. 13-71. Burrtec is requesting a
3.6 percent CPl adjustment for Roll-Off Commercial Rates.

. Pass-through costs including a Greenwaste processing fee and/or the Landfill
Disposal rate. This rate component is impacted by landfill charges and commodity

48



prices. As proposed the DlsposaI/Landflll rate is mcreasmg from $39 50 per ton to
$41.80 per ton, the Greenwaste rate is increasing from $28.00 per ton to $35.61 per
ton; and the RoH Off disposal rate is mcreasmg from $39 50 per ton to $41.80 per -
ton.

. ‘FrequencyFactor Th[s component represents the number of times. per week
~(or other designated period of days) that.refuseis picked up for disposal. The
‘frequency factor provides ratepayers with a graduatmg dlscount rate based on the

number of tlmes of service per week

Bin 5/ze Bins are prowded in the fo!iowrng sizes: 1 5 yards (0 3250 tons) 2. 0 yards
(0.4333 tons); 3.0 yards (0.6500 tons): 3.0 yards/greenwaste (1.3000 tons); 3.0 .

- yards compacted (1.9500 tons); and 4.0 yards/compacted (2.600 tons). Bin size,
- Disposal/ Landfill, and Greenwaste. dlsposai rates determine the monthly cost for this

component _

Franchise fee. The franchise fee is an assessment against Burrtec for the exclusive
right to be the primary solid waste hauler for the City of Montclair, and consists of a

10 percent fee of gross revenue derived from services to commercial, institutional,

and industrial premises, exclusive of revenue from sale of recyclable materials and
disposal tip fees. It is at the dlscretton of the solid waste hauler to absorb or pass on
the fee to rate payers. _

Pavement /mpact Fee. The pavement impact fee is an assessment against Burrtec to
compensate the City. for damage done to pavement caused by refuse disposal trucks
owned and operated by Burrtec. This rate component consists of a 3.5 percent fee of
gross revenue from services to commercial, institutional, and industrial premises,
exclusive of revenue from sale of recyclable materials and disposal tip fees. It is at

~ the discretion of the solid waste hauler to absorb or pass on the fee to rate payers.

New Proposed Fee Components and Classifications

As part of the proposed rate adjustment for commercial refuse services, City staff is
proposing establishing Recycling and Sanitation Fee components to comply with State law,

-and provide for improved sanitation services to the community. City staff is also
-proposing the reclassification of Muitifamily Residential from residential refuse service to

- commercial refuse service. As part of the proposed reclassification, Multifamily
Residential would be divided into two rate categories consisting of Multifamily Commercial
and Multifamily Commercial Bin with associated refuse rate schedules. Burrtec is also

“proposing the creation of several new fees for elective refuse services.

Mu/ttfam//y Commercial. City staff, in concurrence with Burrtec, is proposing the
reclassification of Multifamily Res:dentlal from residential refuse service to
commercial refuse service. The reclassification of Multifamily Residential would
result in a name change to Multifamily Commercial. As part of the proposed
reclassification, the newly named Multifamily Commercial would be divided into two
rate categories consisting of Multifamily Commercial and Multifamily Commercial Bin.
The creation of new rate schedules is also being proposed as part of the proposed
reclassification.

The proposed Multifamily Commercial refuse rate category would apply to multi-
family complexes without private enclosures for refuse bins. Within multifamily

49



complexes, refuse bins are used by any resident and rionresident, and no system
exists to differentiate between customer bins. Multifamily complexes without private
enclosures are typical of apartment complexes with alley acceéss where refuse is -
“collected, and by apartment complexes that do not prov1de unit- deszgnated refuse
bins.

Burrtec initially considered the option of allowing multifamily complexes without
private enclosures the opportunity to determiné the frequency of refuse service
‘based on individual customer need; however, past experience wrth this practlce
exposed a. number of problems including the foEiowmg

v .Customers dellberately chose the least costly refuse’ service avazlabie resu!tlng
in lnapproprlate Ievels of refuse coliectlon : ‘

v Customers dumped thelr refuse mto the bins of other customers because the|r B
refuse service was not appropr!ate for the amount of refuse generated

v Customers were not able to dispose of thelr refuse in thelr deSIgnated bms
- because their bins would be full of the refuse of other customers.

v" Unsanitary conditions pers:sted around refuse bms glven the overflow of refuse
between col[ectlon days. - :

In order to avoid the above issues and properly address community mai‘ntenance_
issues affecting multifamily complexes without private enclosures, City staff, in

- concurrence with Burrtec, is recommending the proposed Muitifamily Commercial -
~category be assigned a monthly flat fee, with unlimited refuse service and unlimited
frequency.

In contrast, the Multi Family Commercial Bin category would apply to multifamily
apartment complexes with private bin enclosures. Residential customers living in
these multifamily units have exclusive, private access to protected refuse bins.
Multifamily complexes with private enciosures are typical of senior retirement
complexes and by apartment complexes that do. provide unit-designated refuse bins.

These multifamily.complexes tend to produce less amounts of refuse and require less
service than multifamily complex without private enclosures. Allowing multifamily
complexes with private enclosures the opportunity to determine the frequency of
refuse service based on individual customer needs would allow Burrtec to better
serve resident needs.

Recycling Fee. The proposed recycling fee of $1.29 per cubic yard would be used to
comply with the provisions of Assembly Bill (AB) 341. AB 341 requires commercial
businesses generating four or more cubic yards of refuse per week and multifamily
complexes with five or more units to adopt recycling practices.. The rate of $1.29
per cubic yard is proposed and would result in a monthly fee of $16.75, based on a
typical 3-Yard Bin Size, at a frequency rate of once per week.

General Sanitation Fee. A General Sanitation Fee of $0.40 per yard, multlphed by the .
collection frequency per month is proposed for commercial refuse accounts. Similar
to the General Sanitation fee adopted by the City Council in 2011 for residential refuse
accounts, the proposed General Sanitation Fee for commercial refuse accounts is '

50



" designed to contribute toward the cost of general community maintenance issues
including graffiti abatement, alleyway maintenance, illegal dumping, property cleanup,
- sanitation services, and-removal of abandoned bulky items in neighborhoods and
- alleyways. In contrast, the General Sanitation Fee for reS|dent|al refuse customers is
$2.82 per month '

.« Implementation of a General Sanitation Fee for commercial refuse accounts is in -
- compliance with City Council d:rectlon prowded at the February 12,2011 Strateglc :
Plannlng Session.. _

7 E/ect/ve Refuse Service Fees

Burrtec is proposmg a category of elective refuse services for commerua[ ratepayers ‘for o
an additional cost. B

_.Proposéd elective serviceé include the following:
v Extra Bin Pickup
"/ 'Lockirtg Containers
v Steam Cteaning
v Bulky Item Trirp :
| v .Bulky ttem P:ckup
v~ Relocation Fee of Roll-Off Containers Renta[ Fee
v'  Rental Fee

Elective Service Fees would only be charged 10 commerual accounts voluntarily agreeing
to access available elective services.

Rate Comparisons

A rate survey of neighboring cities was conducted to compare residential and commercial
refuse service levels and fee structures, and to better comprehend what other cities in the
area charge. The cities surveyed are area cities that contract with Burrtec for refuse services.

Upon completion of the survey, it became apparent that a number of significant limitations
- would affect the validity and reliability of the comparison. Direct comparison of refuse
service levels and fee structures across the surveyed cities provided insignificant empirical
data due to wide differences in fee structures, rate components, service levels, and fee
definitions. '

While the refuse rate comparison established a sense of position within the range of refuse
rates among neighboring cities, it did not establish a clear comparison of cost components
within the surveyed cities. Rate Comparisons attached as Appendix 2 include comparisons
by service and disposal/processing components, and by total rate.

51



Comparatlve surveys do not typlcally offer clarity as to the cost of prowdlng refuse rates
rather, such comparlsons provide a simple tool for showing existing refuse rate ranges for
comparable types of services. The following are srgmflcant factors when conduct[ng rate
comparlsons ‘ :

v Many cities have hot updated their refuse agreements in several years; therefore
- cities that have récently updated agreements will typically have higher refuse rates in
- comparison to- other cities that have not recently ‘adjusted refuse rates. ‘As a result,
- some cities may have refuse rates that may seem substannaliy high in-comparison to .
other cities. —_ ‘

Of the agenCIes surveyed the cities of ngh!and Rla!to and Yucaipa were the onfy
'ones to have undergone recent rate adjustments. The cities of Rancho Cucamonga
and Upland are in the process of adjusting their refuse rates—a new refuse franchise
agreement between Burrtec and Upland was recently considered by the Upland City
Council. The City of Grand Terrace has not sought rate adjustments in-several years
‘and, as a result, is hke[y Lo see 5|gn|ﬂcant rate increases when rate adjustments are
" c0n5|dered : :

v Citiesdo not typically publish or identify refuse rate components. Instead, they simply
state the total fee for commercial and residential refuse rates. As such, it is difficult
to identify What the rate components are for commercial and resrdentla! refuse rates.
Some cities may incorporate a variety of rate components within their monthly refuse
rate including but not limited to administration fees, sanitation fees, recycling fees,
greenwaste fees, and pavement impact fees. As more and more cities begin to
examine the rate structures used by neighboring communities, the use of varied rate
components is becoming commonplace. . An example is the City of Upland, which

~ recently decided to incorporate a number of fee components within its proposed
_refuse service rate.

v ‘Services included in various refuse rates are typically structured differently in each
city, thereby making direct comparisons unreliable. For example, some cities may
charge a general sanitation fee that covers graffiti abatement and street cleaning;
while another city may charge a sanitation fee that only covers bulky item pick-up.
As such, it is difficult to compare services provided by refuse haulers. An example
of this is the City of Upland, which charges high administrative fees to customers to
compensate for the fact that its refuse service rates are not historically tied to a CPI
adjustment. Like Montclair, Upland contracts with Burrtec for refuse services.

~v" Not all cities provide tiered refuse rates such as Nonsenior and Senior Residential -
Refuse Rates.. While some cities may offer a two-tiered system, the formula by which
the rate is subsidized is oftentimes unknown.

v Economies of scale greatly affect the refuse service rate for cities. Typically, cities
with much larger populations that produce vast amounts of refuse are provided
much lower refuse service rates—a factor attributed to the lower cost per unit to
provide refuse service. Examples include the cities of Rancho Cucamonga, Upland,
and Rialto. These cities have significantly larger populations and produce a higher
volume of refuse in comparison to Montclair. Cities with smaller populations and
producing small amounts of refuse tend to have higher refuse service rates, based
on the higher cost per unit to provide refuse services.

52



- Conclusion _

Based on the above ana!y5|s staff requests authorrzatlon to proceed and comply with
Proposition 21 8 notrflcatlon and public hearrng requlrements '

Current and proposed rates effectrve on or about February 1, 2014, and proposed five~
year maximum rate caps for commeraa! and resrdentral refuse services are contamed in -
Table 2, attached as Appendrx i. ' :

'Proposed commercral and reszdentral refuse rate caps:
1. Comply wrth Proposmon 21 8 notrflcatlon/hear!ng requrrements
2. Reﬂect as percent CPI adJustment over the prevrous year '

ftis antlczpated that proposed maximum rate.caps Would avoid- triggerrng Proposrtlon 21 8
requirements during the proposed five- year schedule of maximum rates for commercial
and residential refuse accounts.- : S S

To achieve full complrance with Proposrtaon 218 notrflcatlon and hearmg requirements,
approximately 8,200 notifications would be maiied to residential and commerc:ai property
owners, advrsrng of the fo!lowmg '

1. Date of worksh,op

2. Date of public _hearin-g. before the'Ciry Council
3. Ma'kimum proposed rate caps

4. Computation formula

5. Proposed commercial and residential refuse rates effectlve on or about February T,
2014 :

Increasing maximum rate caps for residential and commercial refuse service would allow
the City to meet its.contractual obligations with Burrtec to apply CPi-related increases and -
other cost-related components without triggering Proposition 218 hearings each time a
rate adjustment is considered; provided total rate adjustments do not exceed respective,
maximum Proposition 218 rate caps for the appllcable year in which they are proposed to
go into effect.

FISCAL IMPACT: The cost to comply with Proposition 218 notification and hearing
requirements is not expected to exceed $12,000. '

RECOMMENDATION: Staff recommends the City Council take the following actions:

1. Adopt Resolution No. 13-3015 setting a public hearing for January 20, 2014,
related to a proposed five-year schedule of maximum monthly rate caps for
residential and commercial refuse services pursuant to the Proposition 218
notification, protest, and public hearing process and directing that notice
thereto be provided to property owners of record upon which proposed fees
would be imposed.

53



. Authorize staff to send notices to property owners regarding a. workshop

and public hearing to consider establlshmg maximum monthly residential
and commercial rate caps for refuse services-pursuant to Proposmon 21 8
‘requirements. :

Allocate up to $1 2,000 from the Contingency. Fund to mail not:ces of a
proposition 218 publlc hearing to property owners regarding estabilshmg
“a five-year schedule of maximum monthly rate caps for re5|dent|al and
commercial refuse services. :

54



Maximum Propo

Table 2 7
sed Monthly Refuse Rates

_ Appendix 1

Household Rate

$

32.001%

33.60

Bin 1.5/Frequency 1

$

10858 § §

11401

Alleyway Service Per Unit N/A $ 3294 1% 3459 % 363215 3814} % 40,05
" Bin i.S/Frequencvl N/A $ 104133 10934|% 114813 12055 f% 12658
" Bin 1.5/Frequency 2 N/A § 19460 | $ 20442 |§ 21464 |$ 225379 23664
"Bin 1.5/Frequency 3 N/A § 28568 % 29996 % 314.06(% 330.71|%  347.25
Bin 2.0/Frequency 1 N/A §  120L51|% 12750|% 13397 |$ 140673 147.70
Bin 2.0/Frequency 2 N/A $ 22050 | $ 231.53|% 243.11]% 255.27]% 268.03
Bin 2.0/Frequency 3 NJA $ 32143 0% 233750]% 354.38§% 37210[% 390.71
Bin 3.0/Frequency 1 T N/A $ 171.731% 18032)% 18934]% 19881}% 208.75
Bin 3.0/Frequency 2 N7A $ 290.2519% 304.76 % 320.00]% 336.008% 352.80
Bin 3.0/Frequency 3 N/A $ 411.021% 43157|% 453.15)% 4758113 499.60
Bin 3.0/Frequency 4 N/A $ 53181]% 55840|% 58632F% 6156408 646.42
Bin 3.0/Frequency 5 N/A $ 65258|% 685.21]% 71947]|% 755.440% 793.21
Bin 3.0/Frequency 6 N/A S 77338 |5 8120503 8526513 89528|% 940.04
Commercial with Recycling:
Bin 1.5/Frequency 1 L3 80678 10037]% 105393 110665 11619 3% 12200
8in 1.5/Frequency 2 $ 14928F% 186.83[% 19617|$ 20598f$ 21628f% 227.09
Bin 1.5/Frequency 3 $ 21789fF% 275.23[% 28899|% 303.44]$ 31861[% 33454
Bin 2.0/Frequency 1 $ 9041 8% 116911§% 12276 % 1289005 . 1353508 142.12
Bin 2.0/Frequency 2 $ 16330f$ 21172)$ 22231)% 23343f§ 245.10[$ 25736
Bin 2.0/Frequency 3 - $ 23620fF% 30805]$% 32345|% 33962f$ 356605 37443
Bin 3.0/Frequency 1 $ 12614]% 16504f% 17329|$ 181.95f§ 191055 200.60
Bin 3.0/Frequency 2 $ 20759)% 276.87[% 20071|$ 305255 320518 336.54
Bin 3.0/Frequency 3 $ 289.05[% 39054f% 41007[$ 43057F% 45210 $ 47471
Bin 3.0/Frequency 4 $ 370505 50464F% 52987]% 55636Q% 584.18)% 61339
Bin 3.0/Frequency 5 $ 45195[¢% 61872f% 64966[3% 68214f$ 716253 75206
Bin 3.0/Frequency & ¢ 53341]% 732830% 76947]% B8079431% 8483405 89076

55



“Maximum Proposed Monthly Refuse R;ites o

Table 2 (Continued)

-Commercial Greenwaste:

s

Appendix 1

. Bin 3.0/Frequency 1 -~ $ 13686 § $ 1545915 ~162321% 170441 % 17896 | $ ° 18791
Bin 3.0/Frequency 2 $ 2290305 26048]% -27350]% 28718F% 301544 316.62 |
-Bin 3.0/Frequghcy 3 1% 321.21 1% 3663915 384.71]$ -40395fF% - 42415]§ l 445.36
Bin 3.0/Frequency4 -~ |'$ . 41338)$ 47227]$ 49588|% 52067 f$  s4670[$ 57404
Bin'3.0/Frequency 5 - | $ .50555)% 578165 607.07]% . 63742f% 669.29]% 70275

: Bin&.O/Frequeﬁcy 6§ " 1$ 597.73 1% 684.06]% 71826 1% 75417 % 791.881% 83147 |-
, Ny - ' . Commercial Compacted: o o -
Bin 3.0/Frequency 1 1% —117?.497 $ 22506 % 23631]% 24813 % 260.54 1% 273.57
Bin 3.0/Frequency 2 - |$ 31029)$ 40143|% 42150]$ - 442.58|$ 46471]$  487.95
Bin 3.0/Frequency 3 1% 443.10] % 577805 60669]% 637.02]% 66887313 70231
Bin 3.0/Frequency4 - | $ 575.90)% 75417]% 791881% . 83147)% 873.041% 916.69
Bin 3.0/Frequency 5 s 7os70]$ 93054]$ 977.07{$ 102592 {$ 107722 |$ 1,131.08
.B]n 3.0/Frequency 6 1% 84151 )% 1,10692 |3 1,16227'13% 1,220.38 15 1,281.40 | § 1,345.47
Bin 4.0/Frequency 3 $ 58765]% - 766.98]% - 805.33]1 3 845601% 887.88)% 932.27
o . Commercial Temporary: ) .
Bin3.0/Frequency7 | $  8035]$ ~ 9218]s  96.79]% 10163{$ 10671 |$ 112.05

X Commercial Permanent Roll-Off:
Bin 40/Frequency 6 $ 378.93 ] % 411.02 } % 431573 % 453.1583% - 47581 ]% 499.60
Bin 25/Frequency 8 $ 45793]3% @ 49462 % 519.351% 545.32 1% 572591 % 601.22
Bin 10/Frequency 8 $ 45793 1% 494.62. % 519354 % 545.321%  57259]5% 60122
Bin 40 Comp/Frequency 8 F$ 45793 8% 49462f% 519351% 54532§$ 57259)§ 60122
_ Commercial Temporary Roli~Off: o
Bin 40/Frequency 6 $ 398.43 1% 43303 4% 4546831 % 4774113% ~ 50128]% 526.34
Bin 25 /Frequency 8 ° $ 48393 1% 52396 1% 550.16 f$ 57767013 606.55 ] % 636.88
Bin 10/Frequency 8 $ 483931% 523.97 $ 55017 4% 577.681% 606.56 | $ 636.89
Bin 40 Comp/Frequency 8 $ 48393 %% 523973% 55017}% 577.681% 606.56 | $ 636.89
‘Commercial Recycling Roll-Off:
Bin 40/Frequency 6 $ 14193 1 ¢ 160.22 1% 168.23 3§ 35 17664135  18547]1% 194.74
Bin 25/Frequency 8 $ 141931% 160.22 1% 168233 % 17664 1 $ 18547 1% 194.74
Bin 10/Frequency 8 $ 14193 § 160.22§ % 168.231 % 176.64 1 $ 18547 % 194.74
Bin 40 Comp/Frequency 8 | $ 14193 ]$ 16022 |$ - 16823 |$ 17664]% 18547 [$ 194.74
Commercial Extra Services:
Extra Pickup $ 41.12 | $ 43.181% 4534 1% 4761} $ 49.99
Locking Container % 6.24]% 6.551% 6.8815% 7221% 7.58
Steam Cleaning (Compactors) $ 8513} % 89.391% 93.861% 98.55]1% 103.48
Bulky ltem Trip Fee - $ 3973 % 41.721% 4381 ] % 46.00 | $ 48.30

Bulky Item Fee {gach item) $ 11351 % 11921% 12521% 13151 % 13.81

Relocation Fee (Roll-Off) $ 85.13 | % 89391 % 938615 98551 ¢ 103.48
Rental Fee (per day} $ 22901% 24051% 2525(1% 26.51]%¢ 27.84

56




128918

'GTES1S.

0geeks

ma_mu:&

"ejey B0l Ag pavuey

_mmoammn pue cozum__oo asnysl 0 m_nmo__nam 1800 j0 com:mano.
uum:u B Sl m:: comtoa a8 Ao syj ur papnoul mmo_?_mm auf U Aiea poAanins mm;_u ‘ay} aous

sley fejo), Ag pasuey

96°9% GL'GES 28°92% 9z'L$ Zo6L$ 5v'9% Li'vLS {pasodol) Jig|ojuow
Y0591 | sv'0T$ CER 24 .N,_...mwm ¥ 96% Avmmoao.p&v d{E2JUon 9g°9e$ 9z i% 0L'8L$ 65'v$ 15°C1LS Jieojuow
om.mmww. 29623 ‘BL9ZLS . ov.”mmm m.\..mww pue(ybiy 8823 £8¢$ G0ZZS 09°6$ S¥ol$ edjean )
-8 Yig LZ°TTS bee L$ | szles .98°¢8% ebuoWEIND ococmm LI¥ZS om,mw. : 12818 .mv.mw TR Ojerd
€LLrLS P LLS . 696213 ANV L4688 BUEJIOS 05'vZ$ eoes 8y'LZ% ..mm.mw €1'alg BUBMIOS
LLBELS z'62% 69°0L1$ 60'62$ 08'18% ST £6°2Z$ 8528 - Ge'0Ts 09’68 , mm,.v_.m pUelUBIH
PL9ZLS No.vw [ R 448 . ,mm.mmw._ AR JEROJUol _ 99'2z% Sov$ t2’gls - 08'6s LWEls ajels) puely
€6 LL1% c'izs 0" 96$. ov.mw,w oo.e.m ) mo.mtu,._.‘v:m._w 88°1CS £ees GoaLs 0568 S0ELs ebucieony o._._o_,._mm
c8¥LIS m\..mww 50588 18'62¢ ¥Z'658 pieldn, G0'tes g6'¢$ 0L'0zs Gzo% FERARS pue(dn
arey h.muoh.. | s8a A0 | ..,,n__uM MM> . m\ﬁwwm,o%m& ‘mu.__bm.m. , mco...h.uim_:a._., a)gy [810L | S884 AUD .a_.um_u“ Ww.> mMmMMMMWQD. 2oIneS suogoIpSLny

‘lesodsip puE Lojo8}o0 asnjal 0} 9|geoidde 1500 Jo uosuedwucd
1054p B S| s1u uoiuod 823 AND 9U} U] papRiou; Sa0IAI8S ay) Ul Alea peAsAIng SaIiD ayl souls

FAE]ES 9688, mm..mm_‘.m... m\,.mm.ﬁ 05'eZ1Ie o .mn__mo_.c., 88'ves £8'zs G0¢Ts 0964 S7'9Lg edleon i
r0's91L% av0z$ 95 vvLs. TLev$ ¥¥'964 {pasodold) Jrejojuol 05 vzs zoes ar'Lzs$ ge'gs £Lels BUEIO
ELAVLS YT LLS 686218 Nﬁ.omw t.mmw BUBIUCY £672Z3 25°es ge02s 0¥’ G67L% pUE|YBIH
ow.mm; 29628 181'9Z1% ob'9zs 8.'66% - vcm_cm:._ 88°9¢% 9z'2% T9'61% 5¥'9% LS Bﬁmmono._& dfeduon
GELvis | L2 ech LLGELS Seles. 98'¢6$ BOUOWEIND OUOUEY 19vzs 066 12818 Gr'G% oz'eLs ojjerd
vr.wmvw Zov$ TL'ELLS 89'92% ¥v'96% CEI9IUOW 88°LZ$ EEEs 65218 05°'5% S0Els ebLOLEDNY OUIUEY
_‘h..mm_.w N_..mm..m. 85°0LLS | 60'6ES 05°18% ojeRt 98'zes o7 _,N.w_.m, 08'6$ WELS euELS] pURID)
CERNE I R ¥4 0¥ 963 0¥'9z$ oo.on, e0ellal pueld)|( 9e'sZ$ 9zl oL'sls. 65°%% -3 diejojuoly
eSS 8.'62% 50°68% i _..m.mmm V2558 pueidn 50'¢Zs g5'z$ 01°02% sTes Ge'Els pueldn
s18y _.Em Lt seed AN ._.WM“ ww.> QMMMMMMW‘Q& BOIMIBS " suopapsunp ajey jB1oy | sesd D ._WMMM\, mMmMMM.MQ ELIAVELS SUORIIPSUNT

- eBleuD Jopuap |g10L Ag pavuey

(12A8] 991AI8S UOWILIOD JSOW SE jaom 43d dnyoud | ypm uig plek g'g)

uosuedwon 2jey 9SNIeY [BI2ISUIWOD

afieys iopush iejo) Ag paduex

wosuedwon 2By 2sney [enuspIsay

N,x_ucmnn<.

mcouomumt:_.. uaamlag suolsluedLIoy djey asnjay

57



RESOLUTION NO. 13-3015

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
MONTCLAIR ESTABLISHING PROPOSED  SCHEDULES OF
TOTAL MONTHLY RATES FOR REFUSE SERVICES, SUBJECT TO
THE PROPOSITION 218 NOTIFICATION, PROTEST, AND
PUBLIC HEARING PROCESS AND IN COMPLIANCE WITH THAT
PROCESS DIRECTING THAT NOTICE THERETO BE PROVIDED

. TO PROPERTY OWNERS OF RECORD UPON WHICH PROPOSED
FEES WOULD BE IMPOSED AND FURTHER DIRECTING THAT A
'PUBLIC HEARING ON SUCH PROPOSED FEES SHALL BE SET
FOR JANUARY 20, 2014, IN THE MONTCLAIR CITY COUNCIL

" CHAMBERS E

WHEREAS, Article XHID, Section 6(a) of the State Constitution (Proposition 218),
passed by the voters of California on November 5, 1996, requires municipalities to
give detailed written notice to the owners of parce!s upon which proposed water-,
refuse-, and/or sewer-related fees or charges are to be applied; and

‘WHEREAS, on July 24, 2006, the California Supreme Court published its
decision on Bigfrorn-Desert View Water Agency v. Beringson, addressing the property--
related fee provisions of Proposition 218, and concluding that in relation to water-;

- refuse-, and sewer-related services where the rates for such services are set by a - .

government agency, such “property-related” fees are subject to the public hearing
requirements of Proposition 218; and ,

WHEREAS, Proposition 218 requires that a public hearing shall be conducted
not less than 45 days after the mailing of a notice of a public hearing on property-
- related fee adjustments to the record owners of each identified parcel upon which the
fee is proposed for imposition; and

WHEREAS, the Notice of Public Hearing shall include the amount of the fee to
be imposed, the basis upon which the fee was calculated, and the reason for the fee,
together with the date, time, and location of the public hearing, and that the City
Council of the Clty of Montclair hereby gives its consent to provide notice thereto;
~and

WHEREAS, such notice is attached hereto and by its reference is incorporated
into the sum and parts of this Resolution and is approved by the City Council of the
City of Montclair for mailing to the property owners of record upon which the
proposed fees would be imposed; and

‘WHERAS, if written. protests against proposed property-related fees are
presented by a majority of the property owners of record upon which the proposed
fees would be imposed, the fee adjustment shall not be implemented; and

WHEREAS, if a majority protest is not received from the property owners of
record upon which the proposed fees would be imposed, the proposed fees shall go
into effect without further action, except that schedules of such fees shall first be
adopted by Resolution of the Montclair City Council; and

Resolution No. 13-3015 58 Page 1 of 7



WHEREAS, written protests can be prov:ded to the Clty in advance and up to
- the date and tirme sét for a public hearing; and

_ WHEREAS a fee shaII not be extended lmposed or mcreased unless it meets
“each of the following requ:rements

| 1. Revenues derived. shali not exceed the funds requrred to prov;de the
property related service. _

2. Revenues derzv_ed shai[ not be used for any- purpose other than that for-

Wthh the fee is imposed
3. The fee lmposed shall not exceed the proportlonal cost of the’ serwce

4, No fee may be :mposed unless the service is actually used by, or

B |mmed|ateiy available to the owner of the property.

s No fee’ may be imposed for general goveérnmental services such as police,
"~ fire, ambulance, or library services where the service is available to the public at large
in substantially.the same manner as it is to property owners. :

: WHERE'A"S" Chapter 6.16 of the Montclair Munioipal Code establishes a
“mandatory Refuse Collectlon Program and a process for the collectlon of service fees
related thereto; and :

WHEREAS effectlve january] 2013, the City Councrl ralsed the 7otal Monrh/y
Refuse Rate to $25.36 per month per nonsenior household—which was below the
- City's maximum authorization for refuse rates under Proposition 218; and $126.14

per month for commercial accounts with at 3.0-yard bin and one plckup per week
(majorlty of commercial customer service level); and :

WHEREAS, the Total Monthly Refuse Rate consists of various rate components
including the refuse service rate, disposal rate, landfill rate, recycling rate, greenwaste

rate, household hazardous waste rate, general sanitation fee, franchise fee, and

administrative rate; and

WHEREAS, Burrtec, the City's solid waste hauler, is requesting, and is
authorized, a rate adjustment pursuant to the terms of the existing franchise
agreement between the City and Burrtec; and

_ WHEREAS, the fiscal viability of the City's General Fund would be required to
continue sharing a significant and growing responsibility for operating the Refuse
Program; and :

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of
Montclair does hereby establish the following justification{(s), rate calculation
methodologies, and proposed schedule of rates for refuse services for the period
February 1, 2014, through January 1, 2019, and that such rates shall be imposed on
all record owners/ratepayers of each identified parcel in the City of Montclair, subject
to the Proposition 218 notification, protest, and hearing process:

Resolution No. 13-3015 59 Page 2 of 7



Justification(s) and Rate Calculation Methodologies: The proposed justlﬁca—‘
tion(s) and rate calculation methodologies for each property owner's: bimonthly
bill for refuse services are as follows:  Pursuant to the terms of the City's
franchise service. agreement with Burrtec (Agreement No.13-71 and
subsequent amendments thereto); refuse service rates are subject to annual -
percentage increases not to.exceed the Al Cities Consumer Price Index (CPI) for
the Los Angeles-Riverside- Orange ‘Co.. area, All-ltems Indexes, All Urban
Consumers, for the year ending in jfanuary. The CPl fluctuates from year to
_year, ‘making it an ‘unstable predictor. for rate: adjustments; but tong-term
‘historic patterns can be used as refliable predlctors these patterns produce .
© averages that, when calculated over specified consecutive periods of years, are
typically at or below 5 percent. The City's formula for annually adjusting the

Total Monthly Refuse Rate is based on the CPI; ‘therefore, ‘projected-annual rate -

increases cannot be predicted precisely. However, based on historic patterns,
the City can project that when applied over the .next five years (February 1,
2014, through January 1, 2019), the average for raté adjustments would not.

. Ilke[y exceed 5 percent per year. Accordingly, and except for the. February 1,

2014 proposed rate adjustment, an annual CPl of 5 percent is the methodo!ogy
-used to project annual rate increases for the Total/ Monthly Refuse Rate.

Based on thls analysis and Just|ftcat|ons contalned in other-relevant sections of
this Resolution, the City Council proposes an initial adjustment for February 1,

2014, that increases to residential refuse so that the Tota/ Monthly Refuse Rate
is $26.88—the actual cost to the City to prov;de residential refuse services.
The senior household rate would be adjusted to $21.50—20 percent less than .
the proposed nonsenior household rate of $26.88. Commercial refuse vary: by
bin size and frequency of collection and those also would be increased to the
amounts present in Table 2—the actual cost to the City to provide commercial
refuse services. The February 1, 2014 rate adjustment would be followed by
annual rate increases over a 5-year period not to exceed 5 percent annually.
State law (Section 53753.5 of the Government Code) provides that, under
Proposition 218, property-related fees can be adjusted on an annual -basis
provided the formula for adjusting rates does not change or does not change in
a way that would otherwise impose future increases that are higher than the fee
formula contained herein would allow; accordingly, annual rate adjustments
may continue mdefmltely under the methodology contained herein.

Table 1 indicates the current 7ota/ Month/y Refuse Rate charged in the City of
Montclair.

Resolution No. 13-3015 60 Page 3 of 7



Table 1 -
- Current Monthly Refuse Rates

Refuse Service Rate B

Dis.posaE/Recy_cl ing/Landfill Fees .

_ |General Sanitation Fee '$2.82 - N/A

Franchise Fee ' o , N/A © $4.02
Administrative Fee : : $3.99 o N/A
Household Hazardous S )

Waste Fee - $0.45 N/A

* Commercial rates vary by size of hins-and frequency of collection. The
. majority of service levels in the City are for 3.0 yard bins collected once per -
week. The rates shown above reflect that service level; however, all service
_levels are shown in Table 2.

Table 2 indicating the City of Montclair's current and proposed rates as well as the
Maximum Total Monthly Refuse Rate for the period from January 1, 2014, through
January 1, 2019, is attached hereto and is incorporated into the sum and parts of this
Resolution. : '

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that all proposed 7otal Monthly Refuse Rates are
approximate. Actual 7ota/ Monthly Refuse Rate charges for each year would not be
higher than the proposed rates, as indicated. In the event rates higher than those
proposed are required to meet program needs, the City is required to reconduct the
Proposition 218 notification, protest, and hearing process. Fees imposed do not
exceed the proportional cost of the service attributable to each affected parcel, and '
revenues derived are not expected to exceed the cost of service. ‘

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that in the event a majority protest of property
owners against the proposed schedule of rates for Refuse services fail(s}, such rate
schedule(s) shall be effective immediately after the Proposition 218 public hearing and
upon approval by the Montclair City Council, by Resolution, prior to implementation.

BE IT FINALLY RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of Montclair hereby
sets a public hearing for Monday, January 20, 2014, at 7:00 p.m., in the Montclair City
Council Chambers to provide interested parties, including property owners, an
opportunity to provide oral or written protests to the schedule of Refuse Program
rates and that only those protests submitted in writing shall be counted.

Resolution No. 13-3015 61 Page 4 of 7



APPROVED AND ADOPTED this XX day of XX, 2013.

- Mayor

 ATTEST:

City Clerk

I, Yvonne L. Smith, Deputy City Clerk of the City of Montclair, DO HEREBY CERTIFY that

‘Resolution No. 13-3015 was duly adopted by the City Council of said city and was
- approved by the Mayor of said city at a regular meeting of said City Council held on
the XX day of XX, 2013, and that it was adopted by the following vote, to-wit:

AYES: XX -
NOES: XX
ABSTAIN: XX

 ABSENT: XX

Yvonne L. Smith
Deputy City Clerk

Resolution No. 13-3015 62 Page 5 of 7



_ ~ Table 2 _ R
‘Maximum Proposed Monthly Refuse Rates

Household Rate : ‘ ) . ]
Bin 1.5/Frequency 1 - . |$. ~71.00]$s 9380 ]$ 984945 10341]$ 10858]¢ 11400

- _ B Multifamily Comm;rcia_l: B
Alleyway Service Per Unit - TN/AT l$ 32043 34.59 )% 363213 '38.14 1% 4005 |
Bin 1.5/Frequency 1 N/A $ 10431313  10934]5 11481 %% 120555 12658
TBn15/requency 2| WA |3 19469 |§  20442)% 21464 |3 22537 )8 . 236564
Bin 1.5/Frequenc_y 3 : N/A - ‘ $ . 285681% 2999613 31496 15 330.71 3% 34725
Bin Z.O/Frequency-] : N/A |8 1215108 1275903 13397 3% 14067]% 147.70
Bim 3.0/Frequency 2 NJA 13 22050 ]% 2315315 2431183 25527035 26803
Bin 2.0/Frequency 3 N/A $ 32143 1% 337504 % 35438 ¢ 372103% 39071
Bin 3.0/Frequency } N/A ]S ~171.73 $ 180.32 $ 18234]1% 19881 ]% 20875
Bin 3.0/Frequency 2 “N/A § 290.25F% 304765 320000% 336.00]% - 352.80
Bin 3.0/Frequency 3 N/A § 411.02}5% 43157 $ 453155 475.81]1% 49960])
Bin 3.0/Frequency 4 N/A 3 531.81 1% 558401 § 586.32 |3 615645 64642
Bin 3.0/Frequency 5 N/A 5 652588 68521 % 71947|5 75544|3 79321
Bin 3.0/Frequency 6 . N/A $  77338]1% 81205fF% 85265 0% 895.28]% 940.04
: o _Commercial with Recycling:
Bin 1.5/Frequency 1 $ 80.67 1% 1003715 105393 11066 F3 1161983 122.060
Bin 1.5/Frequency 2 $ 149.28 } 18683 ¢ 19617 1% 205.98 1 216.28 15 227.09
Bin 1.5/Frequency 3 $ 2178913 2752315 2889914 30344 1% 31861 ) § 334.54
Bin 2.0/Frequency 1 $ 90.41 1% 116911 % §22.76 1 § 128901% 135351 % 142.12
Bin 2.0/Frequency 2 $ 163304$  211.72]% 2223145 23343313 245.10]% 257.36
Bin 2.0/Frequency 3 $ 236.2013% 30805 % 32345)§% 33962)$ 35660 §§ 37443
Bin 3.0/Frequency 1 $ 126.14f8% 165.049% 173.29]% 181.95]% 191.05fF% 20060
fin 3.0/Frequency 2 $ 20759])% 27687 1% 290.71]% 30525)% 32051 |5 336.54
Bin 3.0/Frequency 3 § 289050% 390540% 41007]% 43057§% 45210]% 47471
8in 3.0/Frequency 4 3 37050 |4 50464 §§ 52987 § § 556.36 F % 584.181% 61339
Bin 3.0/Frequency 5 § 451985 % 618.721% 64966]3F 6821413 716251 % 752.06
Bin 3.0/Frequency 6 $ 533411§ 73283]% 7694713 807.94]% 848345 89076

63



~ Table 2 (Continued)
Maximum Proposed Monthly Refuse Rates

o Commercial Greenwaste: . o o ' K
Bin 3.0/Frequency 1 5 13686 % 154590% 16232]s 17044]3 17896 [$  187.9

~ Bin 3.0/Frequency 2 $ 220033  26048)$  27350]$ 287385 - 30154]% 31662
Bin 3.0/Frequency 3 $ 321.21 % 366.39] § 384.71 | § 403.95 1% 424.153§% . 445.36
Bin 3.0/Frequency 4 $ 413.381 ¢ 47227 |$ 4958883 52067 |$ 546.70f$  574.04
Bin 3.0/Frequency 5 $ 50555]3% 578163 ‘60707 )3 63742|% 669295 70275

- Bin 3.0/Frequency 6 $ 597.73]% 684061%  7iB26Q83 75437 |% 7ou88|$ . 831.47

_ Commercial Compacted: : :

_l Bin 3.0/Frequency 1. 1% 17749)43% - 22506{% 236.31 1% 248.13 1% 26054 1% 273.57
8in 3.0/Frequency 2 3 310,29 ) % 407.43 § 3 421.5044% 44258 1% 464.71 F § ~ 487.95
8in 3.0/Frequency 3 $ 44310 | § 57780 |$ 6066903 637023 668873 70231
Bin 3.0/Frequency 4 B 57590 ) % 754.17 |} % 791.88§ % 831.47 $ - 873.04]% 91669

- Bin 3.0/Frequency 5 $ 708.70 | % 93054 1 % 97707 F % 1,02592Q1% 1,077.2239% 1.1 31.08
8in 3.0/Frequency & $ 84151 % 1,10692 1% 1,16227 % 1,220.38 | 1.281.40-]$  1,345.47
Bin 4.0/Frequency 3 $ 58765)8% 766.98§% 805.33 | $ 84560 0% = 887.88 )% 93227

’ Commercial Temporary: . o I
Bin 3.0/Frequency 7 | s 80.35 ] $ 92.18 § § 9679 s 101.63f$ 10671 s 11205
- Commercial Permanent Roll- Off: . o ‘
Bin 40/Frequency 6 $ 378.93]$ 411.02fs 43157f8s . 453a5[|$ 47581 3%  499.60
Bin 25/Frequency 8 $ 4579314 49462 F % 519351% 545.32 1% 57252 1% 601.22
Bin 10/Frequency 8 $ 457.9315% 49462 % 519358 % 545.32 4 % 57259 5 601.22
Bin 40 Comp/Frequency 8 $ 457.93 4 3% 49462 | $ 519358 % 545.3248% 57259]% 601.22
Commaercial Temporary Roll- Off; .
Bin 40/Frequency 6 $ 3984318 % 433.03 | § 45468 % 47741]15% 501.28 | § - 526.34
Bin 25/Frequency 8 $ 433938 % 523.96 | § 550.16 | § 57767 ] % 606.55 § 3 636.88
Bin 10/Frequency 8- $ 483931 % 523.97 1% 550.17 1 % 57768 1% 606.56 { $ 636.89
8in 40 Comp/Frequency 8 $ 48393} % 52397 1% 55017 { ¢ 57768]3% 606.56 | § 636.89
) ) Commercial Recycling Roll- Off: o _
Bin 40/Frequency 6 $ 14193} % 160.22 3 % 16823 $ 17664 | § 18547 ) % 194.74
Bin 25/Frequency 8 $ 141931 ¢ 160.22 } % 1682353 17664} % 18547 1% 194.74
Bin 10/Frequency 8 $ 141,933 % 160.22 1% 168.23 5 176644 % 18547 1% 194.74
- Bin 40 Comp/Frequency 8 $ 141933 % 160.22 8 % 168.23 1 % 176644 $ 18547 § % 194.74
T Commercial Extra Services: .
Extra Pickup $ 41121 3% 43.18]1 % 4534 ) % 4761 )% 49.99
Locking Container $ 6.24 1% 6.55] ¢ 638093 72214 7.58
Steam Cleaning {Compactors) 3 85.13§ % 8939 1% 9386114 98.55]13 103.48
Bully Item Trip Fee $ 39.73 0 ¢ 41,7243 4381 [ 46.00 {§ 4830

Bulky Item Fee (each item} $ 11351 % 119243 1252153 13.154 % 13.81

Relocation Fee (Roll- Off) $ 85.13 8% 8939 1% 93.86 ] % . 98558 % 103.48
Rental Fee {per day) $ 2290 % 24051 % 25258 % 265113 27.84

64




MONTCLAIR

'NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING TO CONSIDER AN INCREASE IN
SOLID WASTE AND RECYCLING RATES AND TO. .
CONSIDER ANY PROTESTS TO INCREASED RATES

~The City Council of the Clty of Montclair hereby gives notice of its 1ntent to review and consu:ler approval of increases to o
the existing residential and commiercial rates charged by the City's solid waste franchisee, Burrtec Waste. Industries, Inc.
'(Burrtec) for the collection of solid waste and recyclable materials within the City of Montclair, The City Council plans- -
~ to review and consider this rate increase at a public hearing scheduled for Monday, January 20, 2014 at 7:00 p.m. in the
City of Montclair Council Chambers. A public workshop is also scheduled for Tuesday, January 7, 2014 at 6:00
p.m.in the City of Montchair Council Chambers to answer (uestions from the public. :

NEW RATES

The intended new rates would increase some amounts to recover cost and charge for new recycling and sanitation -
services. They would be effective February 1, 2014, The listing on the last page of this notice indicates the City of .
Montclair's proposed rates as well as the Maximum Total Monthly Refuse Rates for the period from 2014 through 2018. .
Rate sheets showing components of the rates are available in the Office of the City Clerk. '

NECESSITY FOR THE NEW RATES

The new rates are necessary based on the terms of the existing franchise agreement between the City of Montclair and -
Burrtec, which provides that rates be set to cover direct costs and pass through costs and give the solid waste contractora =
rate of return based on an approved cost proposal. ‘

For residential rates the proposed rate increase amounts fo $1 52 per month and is as follow:

) Reﬁ:se Service Rate: This is for collecting and transpomng refuse to the Materials Recovery Facility (MRF)
Burrtec is requesting a service rate adjustment of $0.50. '

o Landfill Rate: This is.a pass-through of actual transportation and tipping fees paid by Burrtec.  There is no
anticipated increase in the tipping fee; however, the cost to pick up and transport refuse to landfills has increased
significantly, partly because of high diesel fuel prices. Burrtec is requesting an adjustment of $0.23.

e Recycling Service Rate: This is the cost of collecting and transporting recyclables to the MRF. A recycling
service rate adjustment of $0.16.

s Materials Recovery Facility Fee: Pursuant to AB 341, all cities in the state must reach a 75 percent landfill
recovery rate by 2020, As such, the amount of recyclable commeodities that Burrtec is able to collect and process
has increased significantly as a result of state law. Burrtec is proposing a credit of $0.42 per month to
residential rate payers; currently it assesses a $0.9 processing fee. That credit is being passed on in the interest of
limiting refuse service costs to residents.

o  Greenwaste Disposal: The Greenwaste Disposal Fee represents a pass-through of actual transportation and
tipping fees paid by Burrtec. Burrtec is requesting an adjustment of $0.96.

For commercial rates the proposed rate adjustments are as follows:

e Multifamily Commercial. In concurrence with Burrtec, a reclassification of Multifamily Residential from
residential refuse service to commercial refuse service is proposed. As part of the proposed reclassification, the
Multifamily Commercial would be divided into two rate categories consisting of Multi-family Commercial and
Muitifamily Commercial Bin. The creation of new rate schedules is also being proposed as part of the proposed
reclassification.

CITY OF MONTCLAIR 65
5111 Benito Street, P.O. Box 2308, Montclair, CA 91763 {909) 626-8571 FAX {909) 621-1584

Mayor Paul M. Eaton » Mayor Pro Tem Bill Ruh « Council members: Leonard Paulitz, Carolyn Raft, I. lohn Dutrey « City Manager Edward C. Starr



IVIONTCLAIR

Commercial refuse service levels vary based upon yardage collected and frequency of colleetlon A complete table of .
" services levels and proposed rates are present-on the next page; however, for the majority of City accounts (3.0 yard bin
with a collection frequency of once per week) the proposed rate increase is $38 90 per month and is as follow:

s Refuse Service Rate: This is for colleetmg and transportmg refuse to the Materials Recovery Facility (MRF) and
- for State mandated recycling. For the service level of a'3. .0 yard bin and. frequency of once per week, an increase
of $22.44 is proposed.
. e Pass-through Rates: Burrtec is requestlng adjustments fo pass on- franchlse ‘fees and pavement lmpaet fees
lmposed on its operations. The- franchise fee is an assessment against Burrtec for the exclusive right to be the
- primary solid waste hauler for the City of Montclair. Ratepayers currently are charged 4 percent of this which.is
proposed to increase to the 10 percent fee charged Burrtec of gross revenue derived from services to commercial,
~ institutional, and industrial premises, exclusive of revenue from sale of recyclable materials and disposal tip fees
. to'Burrte¢. The pavement impact fee is an assessment against Burrtec to compensate for damage done to
pavement caused by refuse disposal trucks owned and operated by Burrtec. This rate component consists of a
~ 3.5 percent fee of gross revenue from services to commercial, institutional, and industrial premises, exclusive of
revenue from sale. of reoyclable materials and disposal tip fees. For the service level of a 3. 0 yard bin and
. frequency of once per week, an increase of $11.26 is proposed.
* o General Sanitation Fi ee. A General Sanitation Fee of $0.40 per yard, multlphed by the collection frequency per
" ‘month is proposed- which amounts to an-increase of $5.20 for a 3.0 yard bin and frequency of collection of once
. per.week. This is designed to contribute toward the cost of general commumty maintenance issues such as
- graffiti abatement, alleyway ‘maintenance, illegal dumping, property cleanup, sanitation services, and removal of
'abandoned bulky items in neighborhoods and alleyways. .

s These rate increases is necessary fo enable the City of Moniclair to recover its costs of administering the C1tys solid

~ waste franchise and to provide funding necessary to accomplish solid waste disposal, recycling (as required by State law)
~ and to provide sanitation services. In no case will rates exceed the maximum rates approved by City Council 4t the

- public hearing and in previous years the actual rates have been less than would have been allowed by approved maximum
rates.

PUBLIC HEARING NOTICE

The City Council of the City of Montclair hereby gives notice of a public hearlng to be held at its meeting of Monday,
January 20, 2014 at 7. 00 p.m. at the City Council Chambers, City Hall, 5111 Benito Street, Montclair, CA. At this
hearing, the City Council will consider public comments as well as written protests by property owners against the
proposed increase in solid waste/recycling fees and other fees associated with the proposed rates. If written protests are
presented by a majority of the affected property owners prior to the close of the pubhc hearing, the City Council will not
increase the rates as a matter of State law. _ 7

If you would like add1nonal mformatlon, please call the Montclair Finance Departroent at 909-625-9471 or visit our

website at www.cityofmontelair.org. :
FILING A PROTEST

If you wish to file a written protest, please send a letter in a sealed envelope addressed to 2013 Solid Waste Rates, City
Clerk, City of Montclair, 5111 Benito Street, Montclair, CA 91763. Your letter must identify. the real property you own

or rent by street address and assessor's parcel number. Your letter must be legibly signed by anyone of the current
property owners or ratepayers of record.

The City of Montclair must receive your letter at City Hall by 5:00 p.m. on Monday, January 20, 2014, or it must be
presented at the City Council meeting of Monday, January 20, 2014 prior to the close of the public hearing on the matter.

Any person interested, including all solid waste/recycling collection customers of the City of Montclair, may appear at
the public hearing and be heard on any matter related to the proposed increase in rates.

This notice is for mailing distribution no later than November 25, 2013 by the City of Montclair.

66



67

, , p1e8s  |eeTesy  |eTvsis |ewelss  [sovmed 9 Avuanbayy/ore ulg
ez 159y | |ewens 50'vZ8 - J06'EeS | (Aep sad) 99y [EIURY sez0ls  |eweoos  fewzess  Jiozoes  forsess § Aushbaid/o'e Vg
eH'E0TS . [s5868 98'E68 52625 £T'59¢ {10 -{0Y) 924 uonEIORY voriss losopss  |49'02ss  |swseps lzEips t Aduenbedd /0 ulg
teers . |svery festzig 781§ $E'T18 (w1} Yoea) aed weij Aying oe'skby  |sTpept  |seEobt  jrivess Y6t9ses £ Aduanbaig/og uig
doegps.  [00'9bs TRERS [ (74133 sad du) wel) Axjng zoo1es  |esroes  |stiuses  foseszs Imvoond g Auanbaus /o' ulg
Jsreors-  Jeswes - fowess. lesess . |erses (siopedwon) . 162815 Jo'asts  |rrocts  feweors  feswsty 1 Ausnbald/oE uig
85 /¢ - |24, 880§ 559§ $Z"9% . Jaupetuo) Buppor . PISEMUTAID [RIMPWWICD
66'6v§ ' J1oips vE'SHS . |BTERS ZETHS dmplgeaxy or0685  fpt'erss  fpei08§  |sbeoss  |emzezs | o Aouenbaniioe uig
S , 5BIAIBS BIIXT [EIBWWOD 00754§  |szotss  erzses  |owevss  |essiog 5 Aousnbaid/geg utg
Ppopets Jovsers - |poosts feeors  |ezoors | sousnbasy/dwodoruig | - feperss  [eTvasse  fogresss  [esezss  |rovoss ¥ Aduanbaig/oe ulg
vopels - levssrs | |porests  jezesrs  |2zosTs . g Aousnbaiy /0T urg by foresks  |esoebs  |cootes |esioees £ Aousnbali/0e wig
pIYETS  |ebseTs - |porosty T fezsats  |zzosty g fouanbasd /57 urg vsagey  |rgozes  |szsoes - frroszs |sseszs 7 Pusnbali/oe g
vIpeTS  Jobsets o po'esTs.  Jszgeis  |ZToors g Aousnbald /oy Uig o900z [soTels  |se'TeTs {ezes1s  Jpo'sory | 1 /Aousnbald/og uig
T HO-ioY Bulpiosy [epmewiwo) . - evbse  fogoses - |eosees  jsperes | so'soEg £ Ausnbary /g uig
perocds  |eso09s  |89sss§ - |4Tossy {z6'€eSy | | 8 Adusnbasy/dwio) op uig 9g'/s2s  for'sbes  |eveses  Jreees  Jestres 7 Aounbasd/gz uig
lesotos  Jossoms  |swisss |iT0Sss  {Z6'€Ess * g Ausnbaly /o1 wig rTpTs  |sesers  |osszis  Joszers | |iesITs . T Auenbaid/0'Z uig
lsgogas  Issooas  Jegzzss - Jorosss - jeseass g Auanbasy/gz wg psbEEs  |T991Es | |pbigoEs [e6eszs . |ESiT$ £ Asuanbary/s T uig
lpegess  Jszross  |iveews  feovses  feoeevs . 9 Auanbau /gy wig 6002278 ezorzs lee'sozs  |4T96T§  |£879818 g Axuenbaiy/ gt vig
. . HO-||oY Aeloduis), [ermWwWeD : oozels  [srorts  [eworrs . |eesors  |ZE001§ T Aouenbaag/sT wig
zzroos  |eszzss - feesvss  [seerss [eowers g Aousnbaid/dwod oF ulg S :BuIpAsY YiM [ERISLILOD
z2'109%  [eszsss  [eEskss  |se6Iss . |eowevs g Aouanbali/o1 vig " Joores  [szsess  [sozses - lsoziss o jeeesss g fousnbald/prg ulg
lezross  leszzss  feesvss  feesrss  Jeowsrs g Aausnbaid /57 Uiy Jrzeezs  fewsses feverzs  frzsses  Jsszses § Aousnbald/0E ulg
o9'e6rs . MTgssbs |STEStS [ZSTERS  |2Q'TTHS g.fauanbaid/oF UlE  |evovegs  |vostas  |egrosss  Jormssy  |reTess ¥ Aausnbayy/org ulg
- HO-H0Y JUBNTULIR [ERIRWWo) o ooeers  |tersipg  |STESPS LSTEFS C|ZOTTES £ fousnbaid/g-g uig
fsoerrs  Jrooots  |sorors  feroes- . fsrzes | 2 fouenbeui/o’g uig “fowzses  Jooeses  |oooees  osvoes  |szoszs z fousnbaii/ge uig
L ) - hescdwin] [epiatiio) R §0'207§  JI¥RGIS - be'68T$. |zE0818  JELT4ES | - 1Auenbaiy/og uig
szzees  ewzses  Joosess  |ezsoss  [seeass € Aousnbari o'y UIg © frzoees  Jovziss  [sewses  Josuges  feviees £ Aduenbay/oz uig
bty [oriezTs  fRe0ze'ls. |£2esl'Ty |e6'00T'TS . |- 9 Avusnbali/oe ug cogozs  [czsszs  Jrrepes  Jestees  osozes ¢ Aausnbaud /07 uig
s01sT'Ts Jewzzovs feeseots |zo2s68  |psoses § Aousnbaid /g€ mg - lozivrs |esovis |eeeeTs JesZzrg STl 1 Asuenbaud /g uig
) COR e V2 S P S T R T AR T4  Aouanbaid /o°E uig sgibes freosss  loevies |oseezs 189vseis € Aousnbayy/g'T wig
Tezoss  |e9'woas [zoZess  |eoro0as  fogisss © g Aousnbaad /o' uig poroges - |LE'SeEs |bovTEs {Zbbozs |6TEeTS Z Auenbaid/gT utg
se/gvs |ovovs  |eszevs o ostaps - fevTovs g Adusnbali/o'g uig  ssozis  |ssozrg  [iseris  feeeots |ETHOTS T fouanbald/s'T ulg
seizy - [psoozs - [evswes  |ieoses . Jeosezs T Auenbaid/org wg |soops PTBES ZE9Ey - |espes ¥62ES N 134 331125 ABMAB|lY
ST . ."umdnnEou ElIBWWOY - . ) ' ’ [RIJIBWLOD AN ,
groz |- Zroz.c | eroz - | stoz | wIoz | . dmld/azis/oomies cigror | stz | wroz. | dmpd/ezis/eoinses
T Amnuel | Aenuef | ‘rAseguel | Agnuef | °p Areniged [ S Urkrenuel | el | Arenagayy :
o SEGIAT , =T YT A
oy ” N s
TOVETS - [8S'801S  |TP'E0Td [60'96S 08'E6$ 1 Aouenbald/$T Vg
09'EES 00°ZE$ ze'ee °1RY p|OYRSNOH
Proz : oz | sroE Jamypd f32is faoes
ef | r Arenuef B ,

.M..mbnmw.ﬂwm B




MINUTES OF THE MEETING OF THE MONTCLAIR '
" PERSONNEL COMMITTEE ‘HELD ON MONDAY,
NOVEMBER 4, 2013, AT 6:38 P.M. IN THE CITY
" ADMINISTRATIVE OFFICES, 5111 BENITO STREET
MONTCLAIR CALIFORNIA '

Vi

CALL TO ORDER

Mayor Pro Tem Ruh called the meetmg to order at 6 38 P m

3

'ROLL CALL

Present: - Mayor Pro Tem Ruh Councrl Member Raft and-Ci_ty-.;-
~ Manager Starr ‘

APPROVAL OF MINUTES

A. Minutes of the Regular Personnel Comm:ttee Meetmg of -
October 21, 2013 :

Moved by City Manager Starr, seconded by Councrl Member Raft a
and carried unanimously to approve the minutes of the Personne[
Committee meeting of October 21, 201 3

PUBLIC COMMENT - None

CLOSED SESSION

At 6:39 p.m., the Personnel Committee went into Closed Session
regarding personnel matters related to appointments, resignations/
terminations, and evaluations of employee performance.

At 6:52 p.m., the Personnel Committee returned from Closed Session.
Mayor Pro Tem Ruh stated that no announcements wouid be made at

this time.

ADJOURNMENT
At 6:52 p.m., Mayor Pro Tem Ruh adjourned the Personnel Committee. |

Submitt

_for Personnel Committee approval,

Edward CcSfarr ™~
City ager

68
Personne! Committee Minutes - November 4, 2013 Page 1 of 1



€102 ‘1€ 4900300

ONIAN3I HINOW dH1 HO4

LH¥Od3d S.HFANSVIAL

AIVIDOLNOW JO ALID



INRODOV A8 SINIWLSIANI ANV HSYD
HdVYD

SLNNO3OV LNJWLSIANI ONV HSVD 40 INJNT VLS
£ TNA=IHOS

aNN4d A8 SINIWLSTIANI ANV HSYD 40 INJNILVYLS
¢ ATNA3HOS

€102 YIGWIAON HOd ADILVHLS INFWLISIANI ANV ADIT0d LNIWLSIANI HLIM FONVITdWOD 40 SINIWILVYLS
L 3INAIHOS

SINJINOD 20 J719VL



1 3TNAIHOS

‘v10Z ‘0¢ Iudy Buipus pouad yuotu xis ayp Buunp seinyipuadxa josWl 0] sjgeyieAs spuny jusiomns sey A0 8yl “Alod JUSWGSaAY|
B} Ul POZUOYINE SJUSWISSAUI JOLIO PUEB pund juswiseaul AousBy (00T au} Ul pajsaaul ag |m sAsuow snidins JaquiaaoN Buung

€L0C HAINIAON JO HINOW IHL HO4 AD3LVHLS INJNLSIANI

UBILNOIDY

broagimy yeuer \) \

‘foljod JUSLLISBAU| BU) Ul YOS 18S S2Jnpadoid [oRuod [BLISiUl 83 im aoueldwod ur sem A0 sy} 4eqojoQ Buun

Jounon A1 aul Ag psaoidde
£o110d JUSWIISSAUL BU} LIIM SWICILIOD SIY | "SJUSLUNISU] [2I0UBUY SNOLIBA Ul PaISSAUl 98Z'190°0L$ Pey AND @u3 "¢1L0T ‘1€ 18Go1oQ JO sY

INIWIIVLS JONVITINOD

€102 ‘L€ 42q0)20

€102 Y39INIAON HO4 ADILVHLS INJIWLSIANI
aNv
ADITOd LN LSIAN] ZHL HLIM SONVITdNOD JO SINIWALVLS
YIVIILINON 40 ALID



‘SoU 850U) J€ pEleyl

1@ 24 | pung 18U bl eapeBeu AUy uoliesedaud yaBpng Jead

-Piw o) Joud Jo uonas|dwod sieau sioafosd ey uaym papleoss A|jensn ele sisjsuel; esoy), ‘eoefold aimonnseu usidwoose o) SpUN JBUIC WL SiajsuB.) SeAle0s) puny siuL (§)

‘pun 4 Lousbunuod suyy

Wy Jo sanusAes sunink uBnoiy painydese) eq |w pue ssedoid Bunabpng auy Buinp pesselppe Useq SBY 04SP 1BUL SJERA Jold woly syoysp [euceiade pey sey pung siul (p)
‘safiesn JzaA Joud JC) ) SSINGUIAS 0} PUM [BIBUSC) BU} O} PSLBISUBR Sq ||IM SS50Xa SIY | "@0IAaS
1950 Alesse0sU sy Peieacd 0) BiBRA |BosY Joud Uj JUICIYNS Ueeq BABY 858U 'XB) S8iBs aLj) J0 JEd SI8 LOjUm SEXE] SSN PUB LIOBSURY SazZiin uoneledo soines 1q8p siul, {g)
"PEAIBYSs S JUSILISSINGLISI Jey) INUn sANeBaU &g o) 888 JO USLWIOOUN
jeu sty 'sioRuey) seipushe BunuelB sy wey Juswasinguas) Bupuad seinipusdxs Jaa0d o} Al saiuow |ood [sush szin 1eus spun) uRIB sgesinguis) ae ssayl {Z)
"$80.N0SE) Pal0LEa) BUIZIIN 10U S| A0 8, 'DEAISIS) S8 SUDNOSIICD SSCL LN SPUN4 SAISSEY PUN (ElsUeD) Jaw
pue pund Aouebujjucy) sy Ag pessaca S| SIYT 'SUDN0S00 Xe) safes pue Auedold Bunieme Jead [2osh auj Jo Ajuolew sy 10j yseo eanebau g sey pung [guoneledp |Rieuan ay) (1}

B0'G/Z /8E 91T 00°08 68°LLEZLEES B0E55' DE6'CS 98°2£0'680"L18
{1) "2 '66E'008'9% 00°0% oc'0% zeZeoTs 0£°912'€98°9%
L0'e6L' LS 6o'0$ 00'0$ 00'0% L0'e52' 228
{1} cooLg'sse'es 00°0$ 00°0% 000 £o'0L8'58e S
(8} (520e'129) 00°0% £R'EE0'SLE 0008 (rLes2'ed)
18°6Lz'ors 00°0% 00°0% YO TOLS LLELS'STE
0Z°£8R'0b% 00°0% 00°0% 06'0% 02'ce8'sbs
18°9/1'28% 00°0% 00°0% 12'86L°ZLS 95°8/9'69%
0L PLE'P9Z' LS 00°0¢$ 00°0% S5 LLL'96% cl'l6L'est' LS
98'ZLS'VBES Do'0g 00°0% 50°152'chS LETLZe LTS
4L '6¥2'Z28 00'C% 00'0% 0Z'L40't$ geziL'LzS
§2'0.5'008'CS 00°0% 00°0% 807282018 2LERLGELES
89'LiF'98L' LS 00°0% 00°0% 00'0$ 99’1 Lol LS
LLBLe'otbS {98°512¢%) ¥B'1LBE 1028 Lo 282" t2cd 08'6Z6'088¢
(&) (9g's89'680'18) 00°0% 00'0% 00°002'821$ (og'528'291°1%)
2Le08'061'cS 0008 69'L.B'ZS Q008 L75.9'66L°C8
¥) (cL'v59'L6vS) 00°03% 99'¢Z.'LES QL0508 (2L GEF 99v)
{z) (9g+554%) 00°0$ 9E¥568 00'0% coog
00'8.7'6Z% c0°0s$ c0'0% 00°88L'PLS COBEL'PLS
£0°€56'6% 00°0% 000$ 00°0% £0'£66'68
00'68Z% 00°0% 00°0% 0osrLg 00°rLE
£5°6LL% 00°0% 0e'vzes z9.5% 128063
00°sLL'vES 00'0% 00'0% 00'0$ 00°541'vTS
85°960°2% 00°0% 00'529'2% 00'0% 65°LTL'YS
L8716L%ES 0008 FAR:) A 00'000'12% ¥.'510'8%
00°03% 00°0% 00°0% S6'166'GLE (56°166'51%)
LI'BLS'6YS 00'0% ¥0'8v2'9% 05°8E5't$ 11'882'L5%
(2) (Z966°LL9) 000% 86'988'LS 68°GEE'828 (e6°8.Lt'8ES)
{2} (1ezpi'ess) 00°0$ 08 LLL'LLYS LETIR LIS (r9'206'58%)
91'¢BB'TES 00°0% 00°0% a0'0% 91'266'788
8/°/68'6% 00°0% 8L EErs 0Lz8% 98'8+Z'0L%
29'129'1% 0o'o$ 00°0% 00'0% 19°128'1%
FrGLL 288 {P0°501'651%) 00°0$ 6LOLF'ELS 62°0.8'ZLZS
oo'c$ o000 00°0% 00°0% 0008
A 00'0% 00708 00'0% vZ'eoss
¥9°'0Z8'TrE 00'0% 00708 00°0% $9°0Z8'ehe
9Z°0/5'88% 00°0% 00°0% L1°B2e'r1S 80°Lv6'vTE
(@) (28°01L9'888) 00°0% LOLEE LS 00'62¢'128 (o2'209'8¥8)
yE'SLL'eLS 0008 0008 00°0% PEGLL'OLS
16°269'62¢ 6008 00'608°'L % 00°0% 15'905°'1£%
{2) (s67cal'L1%) 00°03% BE'C0TLLS 99°/85'FLE (zz'sPL'68)
ler1ee'sels 00'0% L€'0.6'2% ¥6'E0E" LS PL'E06'FTLS
0Le9t' LGS (ot'60Z'19%) 000 22°62E'OFE ZLZre 998
59'+£8'06%% co'0$ 6L'9VL'VS 8LTLF'ES 80'891'L8v%
00°6806'2% 00°03% 00°0% 00°502% 00'vee' LS
£2°209'v0L$ 00°0$ 00'8ZLS LopZei LIS 9€'206'E6$
92 152'3¥2'L$ 00°03% 00°0% 10°59.°8€% §Z'Z66'502°1S
06°8k9'8LZ'L$ 0008 6L'Ch'651% 8ECLOYELS L8 ISH'EVT LS
{1} (85°z09'96Z'sE) 0€'085°022% GO'LRL'696'ES POISP LBL LS (ig'zog'ope v}
asuejeg sigjsued) SIUDLIBBINKSI] sxdianey aaue|eg
Buipuz punpagu| Buumbag

€31N03HIS

£102 ‘1¢ 1890120 4O SV
aNNd A8 SLNIWLSAANI ONY HSVD 40 AINTFWALVILS
HIVIOLNOW 40 ALID

TSADUTIEY | SEY SAJEDIU UD SSI0N

SIVLCL

SaMI859Y puUn [Bieuse) peudissy
pung diysiosuodg WInoA

pung fousBuguon

puny aInonisel

294 SjEpdn UBld [BISUSD

nal u; BuipurolBiapun Aumn

894 10EdW| JUBWBAB DB8HINYG
UoiBay - sas ] joedw; Jadojpasg
|e0oT - sead pedw; :adojeasg

894 uoisuedx] Jemesg

pung AousBy Aupn sadw pugug

B pun4 jusiwese|day Jemes
pund SoUBUSIEL JomeS

801A8S 1080 PUOg BNUBASY BSBS| 500
WaWdol@Aa(Q AWOUGDT

pun4 oipsweled

ern Buisnei) YBhnoay | sdo)|
els [eueweddng S35V

JUEID) Uofepunad A)UNtWLON
el seomeg Hoddng Jojues g||| epL
ISy Ja1UaD 8aInosay ASINO
WEIS) SJUSUELLID J9S|BY

=i Aepp panup Apleg N

JUEZS) UopBZIUNWW] JSINO

sjuEIS) Juawyedsq Alejeg

pung weln g isiid

pund juels) abuzys Joy suoidweys
pund welbcld [couos Jeuy

Jueln) Bugokoey

pung uopuaasld awud

JUEIS) HOO|F JURLUBTIONT MET |BOOT
pund jualanicug me [eswaiddng ayerg
pun4 juel9 1osiq [0oyos
Ainseal| - pund aun}jauod [eispad
punjang g9¢ L L UOROSS

[e1epad - pund aimlayog

. pusd A2ieS dland 60§ €S
801 €9/ 0g doig

93E1S - punf ainyatioy

pung uonuiny Jolues

pun 1sru ), Juawaaoidws Aleny Jiy
PuR4 "5°8'qQ°0

pung jusLdo@aag Jeq

pund 924 ss800y Alligesiq

pund fisjeg el

pungd | ainseapy

pund Xel seo

pung [ezeuacy




“Mueq 99SS0UUD | 1814 WO POUIEIAC SaNRA JoM Bl JUa.Ung

ZeseliigeoL B TYLOL
000000008 3 00'0CLPLE L
00°000°000' 00076 186'L %000+ LLIGLLL TLSLILL 000°000' YINNS
00°000'000° 000F6'F/6'L %0060 LLFLLL ZhiFLiLL 000'000°'C YIANNS
00000000 00°000'F26'L %G.8°0 LLIELLL ZLELILL 000'000'Z g7H4
£0°000'000'2 00'09Z'¥86°L %0L80 LLIBLIOL ZLgLioL 000'000'z 8244
{sieaj ¢ J8AQ) 831LIHND3AS ADNIOY SN
0L B6Y8'6VS > £9°'6/6'LSS
0L'6¥8'6¥5 £0°6/5'185 %OFEL LOZICIE LLIPLIFO 000'0SS YOV
{s1eed ¢ 01 1) SFILIANNDAS ADNEDY SN
8G'OEP LIS § TOTE0'TLE )L
LO'eSL 2L LO'EGL' 4L umouNUN UONEPUNOS AJLUNWIIOD BILICHIZD/M USBD
25°€89'6R0°L L9B/2'OF0") %0920 {div1) pung uswisaau| Aousby jeoon
00°000"'8¥ L 00'000'eYL %058 chizhiLl OLZLILE sueg Ay - 4o
00°000°0¥2 00°000'01C %00 L ANTARIAN 0LioLWLL yueg aypeiN - Q9
S3A]LIHNDIS ADNADY 'S'N WHIAL-LHOHS
ANV ‘SLIS0433d JIvT 'S0 LNIOV TvISIHM HSVYD
vo'eer'oze’s ¢ Wnoooy Bupoeyn
INNODIV ONIMITHD
HEEIR 1809 1B ERTETN a1ey a3e() aje(] anep Jed
aoueleqg oW 188219 Aumen aseysing
uaung uodnon

£ ATMNAIHOS

£10Z ‘L€ 1940300 40O SY
S1NNOJOV LNJWLSIANI ANV HSVD 40 LNIWILVYLS
HIVTIOLNON JO ALID




%S'0
uollEpuUNo
Alunwwo)
%9 V)
4Iv1

%S'vS
SIUBLIISIAUL

%9°8€
BuoaYd

SLT'L8E9TS SIUBWISAAU] B USED [R10L
£10Z ‘I€ 129010
INNOJDV A9 SININLISIANI ANV HSYD
HIVIDLNOW 40 ALDD




CITY OF MONTCLAIR AS SUCCESSOR TO
THE REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY
TREASURER'S REPORT

FOR THE MONTH ENDING

October 31, 2013



TABLE OF CONTENTS

SCHEDULE 1 - STATEMENT OF CASH AND INVESTMENTS BY FUND

SCHEDULE 2 - STATEMENT OF CASH AND INVESTMENTS

CASH AND INVESTMENTS GRAPH



CITY OF MONTCLAIR AS SUCCESSOR TO
THE REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY
STATEMENT OF CASH AND INVESTMENTS BY FUND

October 31, 2013

PROJECT AREA NO. |
Low Income $ 0.00
Tax Increment 0.00
Operating (10,825.51)
PROJECT AREA NO. 1l
Special Housing $ 0.00
Low Income 0.00
Tax Increment 0.00
Operating 0.00
PROJECT AREA NO. IIi
Low Income % 0.00
Tax Increment 0.00
Operating 190,245,580
PROJECT AREA NO. IV
Low Income $ 0.00
Tax increment 0.00
Operating {11,678.57)
PROJECT AREA NO. V
L.ow Income $ 0.00
Tax Increment 0.00
Operating 125,039.70
MISSION BLVD JOINT PRCOJECT
Low-Moderate Housing $ 0.00
Tax Increment 0.00
Operating 24,740.54
ROPS 7 : 0.00
ROPS Areall 0.00
ROPS Area Il 0.00
ROPS Area lil 0.00
ROPS Area IV 0.00
ROPS Area V 0.00
ROPS Area V] 0.00
BOND PROCEED FUNDS
Tax Exempt Bond Proceeds 9,810,359.53
Taxable Bond Proceeds 4,451,951.10

Unreimbursed September payroll liability

TOTAL CASH & INVESTMENTS BY FUND

Schedule 1

(10,825.51)

0.00

190,245.80

(11,678.57)

125,039.70

24,740.54

0.00

14,262,310.63

43,644.58

14,623,477.17




Schedule 2

CITY OF MONTCLAIR AS SUCCESSOR TO
THE REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY
STATEMENT OF CASH AND INVESTMENTS
October 31, 2013

Maturity Interest Market Book
Date Rate Value Value

Checking Account
US Bank 723,007.32 723,007.32
Investments
LAIF 0.26% 766.36 765.92
Bond proceed funds
CA State Variable Purpose Refunding 10/0118  5.00% 1,401,058.40 1,190,000.00
CA State Variable Purpose Refunding 04/01/20 5.00% 3,876,008.80 3,365,000.00
Chabot-Las Positas Comm College 08/01/19  3.00% 1,640,686.50 1,525,000.00
CA State Dept Water Central Valley 12/01/119  3.00% 1,180,425.75 1,085,000.00
Bay Area Toll Authority Refunding SF 04/01/21  5.00% 1,892,693.25 1,675,000.00
CA State Variable Purpose Refunding 02/01/20 4.00% 1,116,730.00 1,000,000.00
LA County Met Transportation Auth 07/01/20 5.00% 2,406,640.00 2,000,000.00
Premium paid on investments 2,159,703.93
{to be recovered upon sale)
TOTAL CASH & INVESTMENTS 14,238,016.48 14,623,477 .17

NOTE:

Pursuant to the Successor Agency's investment Policy, all moneys exclusive of bond

proceeds which are invested pursuant to the bond indenture, are invested in banks, the Local Agency
Investment Fund and securities in accerdance with the Investment Policy

The Successor Agency has sufficient funds available to meet expenditures during the six-month period

ending April 30, 2014.

During October, the Successor Agency was in compliance with the internal control procedures set forth

in its Investment Policy.

ik fideal

Michael Piotrowski
Finance Supervisor



%S0 G6
SJUBWISOAU|

%100
pund JusLwisaAU|
fousby (B207

%¥6'¥
1uno2oY Buoayn

LIV'ETOVLS - SludlIISaAU| '@ YSeD [eJ0L

€10Z ‘L€ 1940300
HdVy9 SINIWLSIANI ANV HSVD
ADNIOV LNINJOTIATATYH FHL O HOSSIOONS SV HIVIOLNOW 4O ALID




CITY OF MONTCLAIR AS SUCCESSOR TO
THE REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY
WARRANT REGISTER

FOR THE MONTH ENDING

October 31, 2013



Project Area |

Project Area 11

Project Area 111

Project Area IV

Project AreaV

Project Area VI - Mission Blvd
RORF

(Redevelopment Obligation
Retirement Funds)

Tax exempt bond proceeds

Taxable bond proceeds

Note:
US Bank transfers

City of Montclair
Final Warrant Register
Council Date 11/18/13
Regular Warrants
Checking Account: Successor to the RDA

US Bank
Voided transfers -
Warrants Checks out Area Totals

354.00 0.00 1,062.52 1,416.52
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
8,570.20 0.00 12,658.34 21,237.54
2,050.00 0.00 8,044.19 11,894.19
6,498.00 0.00 12,749.18 19,247.18
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
52.50 0.00 0.00 52.50
22,50 0.00 0.00 22.50

18,456.20 0.00 35,414.23
October 2013 Total 53,870.43
35,414.23

Transfer out to City to reimburse for September 2013 payrolls

Vice Chairman Ruh




079581
07T
0528
00'861°9
00°056°C
07688
00°#5¢€
JOROUIY

[eyo ], Moday

$pa001d pucg s[gexe]
spasdel pueg 1duexg xe],
pun Sustesed(y A Bary 100[014
pung Suneiad() AJ BIIY 102[01g
ung SuneiadQ 1] BTy 10ofo1g
puny Bugeisd( | vory Yosloig
TORAHG

«DMW (INNOSOY HDNIADIHD

SINVIIVM dv1N0Td

1T :ALvd TIONAOD
,@m&m@mﬂ_ INVIIVAL TYNIS

FIVIOLNOW JO ALID

0Z8¢C
018¢
0cst
0erT
GCET
0TiT
punj

60-%1 E1/L0/11



I o82g (INd 60°T - €10T/L0/11 ) 12qUinp] 10pUS A K 1ISITNY IOUPNOA - IV
507 - $30In053Y ARy BIFAIU]
ueyd
1708 00°09 £10T/TI01 €10Z/€2/01  VeEIolTFzociizl  pwdw doid oBuer Suof $oag fesrerddy 00000-00¥-06ZES-61EH-0Z1Z  100Wdl 120800
S0 - $201N0sY Aresy eidanu]
uejd
1208 00°875°¢E £10T/+T/01 £10Z/TT/01 €I01T#20cI121 Jwduw doid oFuei Juof soag fesrerddy 00000-00F-06ZES-61EF-025T  TOOMMII 120800
SO - $30IN0STY AIeay BIEAU]
ueyd .
1208 00°05+°Z E10T/FT/01 £10Z/72/01 €10114Z0c11T1  YuSwt doud aFues Juo| soag testeddy 00000-001-06ZES-61€H-0TFT  TOOWAL  EZ0O800
SO7T - $20IN05YY A[Bay BISAUL
wepd
1208 00°825°¢ £10Z/+2/01 €10Z/22/01 cio1tpzoerizl  wudur doxd sSues Buof soag fesieiddy 00000-001-06ZES-61EP-0TET 10OV 120800
SO - 90108 AJ[eaY BISMU]
ueyd
1208 00'¥6Z £10T/¥T/01 £10Z/22/01 €10114z0cT1z]  nuSw doxd aues Buof soag Tesieddy 00000-00F-06ZEC-61€F-0TIT 100l 120800
00'SL 0Z0800 YPNOA
yueq 295saUU3 ] 1SH
0708 052 E10TA4TOL €107/5T/60 0068£05 E1/$T/6-€1/97/9 s39f Surdesyjages 00000-00£-010L£-0000-0787 #1081 OZOR0O
yued 998S3UUS ] 18413
0708 05T £10Z/4T/01 E10T/5T/60 0068£0S £1/57/6-€1/97/9 539§ Surdasyayes 00000-00€-0102£-0000-0187 #1084 OZ0R0O
00°057°T 610800 :194oN0A
D77 xusisoipudg
6108 00°05T°T ET10Z/4T/01 €I0Z/8L/01  QI0I/9€L9-Z191y ¥ vd Hodoyf 918g9y] 98eniqry wiiapuf D0000-00b-06TES-6EEF-0TST  J00PUOH 610800
OTH8LE 810800 -1OYIMNOA
UOI[RJN JHOA MBN JO urg 241
puoq s[gexe],
3108 0T H8LE S10TAT/01 E10T/LTI60 9E6SELT-TST FL00Z 7 201V ¥BL VL00T £vd 00000-00v-0€TES-GIET-0ZET  SO0NUBE  ST0R00
HII) unowy e g Od 2eq sl ON AUY uondLiasag I2quInp] JENOIIY IUEN/ON J0PUIA IIYINO A
HMIY T LNOW Wd 60:Z - £10T/L0/1 | “panutsd

pismonordur :1asp}

JaqunN JOpus A Aq RISISY IDYINOA

J[qeArd SIUNOIIY




7 o8eg (INd 60°T - €10T/LO/TT  2qUINN IOPUIA A 108155 WUINOA - JV

07958 [0, voday
0$°68¢ £T0800 -39YoN0OA
Y % UOS[IRY) ‘20304 ‘Burpeng
€208 05°LY E10T/¥T/01 £10T/60/01 £16001 €1/0%/6 Surpua powsad 1o so8rey]) 00000-00b-01TES-61EF-0TET  TOOBRS  £T0800
By % Uos[e) ‘eooo & ‘Surpeng
€708 00°7TE £10T/+T/01 £102/0£/60 £10£60 £1/1£/¢ Suipus pouad 10 ssErey) 00600-008-01ZE5-61EF-0TET  TOOBBS  £Z0800
05 LE1 TZOS00 1eYonop
ABMEDIOH % SUIGHOY
1esodoad
z708 0¢° L6l £10T4HT/01 CL0Z/1E/80 6001-00 0£09T 52000y ANy RIFMIL] mllAy 00000-00F-012€5-61€F-0ZEC  $00GA0  ZTOSOO
00°008°TT 120800 :1ayono ‘
5077 - S90IN0sY Aoy BISaju]
ug[d
1208 00°0TL £10THTO1 EL0T/€T/01  VEIOEIvZOST1ZT  jwdw doid o3uel Suof soAg [esteiddy 00000-00F-06TES-61EF-0Z6T  TOOMII  1TO800
S0 ~ Sa2IN0SAY Aljeay BASaqu]
ueyd
1208 007008 E10T/FT/0T €10Z/€Z/01 VEIOTIpZocEIZT  ywSw doad sBuer uo] s0Ag [zsteaddy 00000~00b-06TES-61EF-0ZHT 100V 170860
507 ~ SA2IN0SAY AljBaY BASo1u]
ueyd
1208 00°0ZL, £1024T/01 EI0Z/ET/OL  VEIOLIvZOCEIgE  yudur doid oSuer Fuof soag jesteaddy 00000-00F-06TES-61€F-0ZET  TOOMII 120800

}23Y) junowy e Juyg Od e Ayl ON AUj wonduasag JAQUINN JIN0IIYIUEN/ON J10PUI A JFINOA



CITY OF MONTCLAIR
HOUSING CORPORATION
TREASURER'S REPORT

FOR THE MONTH ENDING

October 31, 2013



TABLE OF CONTENTS
SCHEDULE 1 - STATEMENT OF CASH AND INVESTMENTS

CASH AND INVESTMENTS GRAPH



Schedule 1

CITY OF MONTCLAIR
HOUSING CORPORATION
STATEMENT OF CASH AND INVESTMENTS
October 31, 2013

Interest Market Book
Rate Value Value

Checking Account
US Bank : 644,512.02
investments
LAIF 0.26% 1,680,382.63 1,5679,486.56
TOTAL CASH & INVESTMENTS 2,223,998.58
NOTE:

Pursuant to the Corporation’s Investment Policy, all moneys are invested in banks, the Local Agency
Investment Fund, and in securities with maturities of no greater than three years,

The Corporation has sufficient funds available to meet expenditures during the six-month period ending
April 30, 2014.

During October 2013, the Corporation was in compfiance with the internal control procedures set forth in its
Investment Policy.

LY LAl
Michael Piotrowski
Finance Supervisor

1

Z:\Department_Shares\Finance\Secure\MHC\WMHC-Treasures reportiFY 13-14\MHC TR Celeber 13.xls



%0LL
pun4 JusW}sSaAU|
Aousby 2207

%062
uNo22Yy Bunjosyn

666°CZZ‘Z$ - sJUaWSAAU| R Yse) [ejo]

€10T ‘L€ 4890320
HdVHD SLIN3INLISIAN]I ANV HSVD
NOILVYOdH OO ONISNOH
HIVIO.LNOIN 40 ALID




CITY OF MONTCLAIR
HOUSING CORPORATION
WARRANT REGISTER

FOR THE MONTH ENDING

October 31, 2013



City of Montclair
Final Warrant Register
Council Date 11/18/13

Regular Warrants

Checking Account: MHC

ACH Voided US Bank
Warrants Transfers Checks transfers Totals
26,034.94 0.00 0.00 0.00 26,034.94
October 2013 Total 26,034.94

US Bank transfers:
None

Vice Chairman Ruh




F6'+€0'9T ‘fero, 1oday

F6HE0°9T pun [g1aush) 106€
junouy [(OY3T INRIET puny
umﬁ JINNODOV DNIADIHD
SINVIIVM v I1NDTA

M__M:w_ HIVA TIDNNOD
dIISI INVIIY M TYVNIA

AIVIDINOW 0 ALID 15T £1/90/11



1 o8eq (Nd 1T€ - £107/90/11 ) 10qUINN I0PU A AF] JISIZNY IDYIMOA - IV
07 U0SIpY BIWIOJ[RD) WiayInog
LiT¥ 81 £102/01/01 EI0Z/H0/01 €101 OLOLBELEET E11160-C1ZI80 API2A ORd FHFS 00000-00F-00195-0LEV-1008  BI0MOS  LTIH00
0)) HOSIpF BRLIOKIED) WISIN0S
LIT1¥ 6E°¢ £107/01/01 £10Z/8T/60 €16 LF8LYO9EET ETE160-E1CT80 SPIPA OTR] FH1C 00000-00F-00T9S-0tEF-100E  10MOS  LITH00
00°008°t 911¥00 ~RYIMOA
- oudag 7 Suqunid ya] 01d
911+ 007056 £10T/01/01 £10T/5T/60 0bZz  shedarandas Tomas - 9pISA OBd FHYS 00000-00F-0L19S-0£€P~100E  T10L03d  SIIFO0
andag % Suiqunid yoal oid
ey
911¥ 000ss £102/01/01 E10T/ST/60 6ETT ondog AouaBiours - IPIIA OBd HHS 00000-00F-0L19S-0EEF-100E  1I0LOAd  QLIF00
007061 STT¥00 ~IaYonoA
2088 SIAUM() SMODEBIA JIB[IIUOIA
SHIYy 0008 £10C/01/01 €10T/01/01 £10T AON £10Z AON, - BI3pRI] £CE0T 00000-00F-00195-0EEP-100E  EVOWOW  S11+00
D088V SIAUM() SMOPESIA JIB[IIUOIA
€1y 00708 £10T/01/01 £10T/0T/01 £10T AON E10T AON - 2IopRId 06£01 00000-00%-00195-0EEF-100€  E¥0IUOIN  CTTF00
2085y SIaUM() SMOPEIJA JIBPIIUOIA
SIt¥ 00°0& £10Z/01/01 £10T/01/01 E10T AON £10T AON - BIODRIJ (8EQ] 00000-00F-00198-0LEP-100€  £FOWOWN  STIF0D
00'S05'y FEIP00 “1sYonoA
eIuIjE[} SoUBTAITElA adesspue]
14944 00605y £102/01/01 £10Z/01/01 £10Z ydag soradord DHW - 0ag £107 3d2g 00000-00v-00195-0tEF-100€  T10P™BL  H1TH00
DL Ese £T1¥00 -13UINCA
JBI20SSY SIAUM() SUSPIRD) BUDJH
Elly £6'601 £10C/01/01 £10T/01/01 £10T AON E10T AON - ©30Ue]) 6L 00000-00¥-0019S-0£EF-100E  F00SIPH  £11F00
IBIO0SSY SIAUM() SUSDIRD) BU[AH
13084 SEEPT £10Z/01/01 €102/01/01 €10T AON £10T AON - eB0uE)) 00000-00F-00196-0EE€F-100€  T00FH  €11#00
b.BEllle] unowy e g Od 2eqg aug ON AUu] uondiiasaqg JqUINA] JUNCIIYIWEN/ON I0PUIA IIYINOA
Em _..m_,.,..l_ UFZD _\),m N TTE - €T0Z/90/11 Pt

psmonordus 1aspy

IDqUINN JOPUS A Ag I91SISIY IOYONOA

dlqeAeJ SJUNOIIY




Z °9Bed (d 1Z:€ - €10T/90/11 ) QNN JOpus A A 191SIFY IDYINOA - JV
B0 JO A1

611¥ $T'99€ £10Z/YE/01 £10Z/10/01 €101 SLILIO £10£60-£11080 1SIUWY 06£01 00000-00F-00195-0CEF100€  TOOWOW 611400
LEIIUOIA JO AND

611¥ ¥7°99¢ E10TAZ/01 £10T/10/01 €101 1£8510 £10£60-€1 1080 ISIYULY 01301 00000-00F-00195-0EEF-100€  ZOOIOW 6100
TEREINIOIA JO A0

611% y7'99¢ E10TAHT/O1 £10Z/10/01 €101 196E10 £L0E60-E1 10RO ISIBYWY (EEOT 00000-00F-00195-0EEF-100E  TOOWON 61 TH00
TEEIUCIA JO AT

611% ¥T'99€ E10Z/4Z/01 £10Z/10/01 €101 +8SE10 £10E60-C1 1080 ISI9YUIY 0R£01 00000-00%~00195-0EEH-100E  ZOMUOW 611500
IIB[IIUOIN JO A1)

6i1Y 9516 £10Z/7T/01 £10Z/10/01 €101 SESEE0 £10£60-C1 1080 Poomua2Is) 16701 00000-00FQ0195-0EEF-100E  ZOMUOIN  BLIHO0
IrROUOW JO A1)

6HI¥ ¥T'99€ £10T/+T/01 £10T/10/01 £10T 98EET0 £10£60-€11080 BS0URD 6L 00000-00F-00195-0E€F-100€  TOOWIOIW  6T1+00
Ire[oRUo Jo 1D

611% 96’16 £10T/PT01 E10T/10/01 €10t €6TET0 £T0£60-€ 11080 [BUU2D 1701 00000-00%-0019$-0EEP-100€  TOOWOI 611400
JR[IUO JO A

611% ¥T'99¢ £10TPT/01 E10Z/10/01 €101 109210 ET0£60-E 11080 ISIUIY £1£01 00000-00v-0019S-DEEP-100E  TOOWOIN 611100
Iepuop Jo A1

611% $7'99¢ E10T/ATI0L £10T/10/01 €101 009210 £10£60-€1 1080 1SI9YUTY €8E01 00000-004-00195-0€€H-100€  ZOOWOIN  611+00
IRpIUOA Jo A1

611¥ 6°0F9 E10T/FTIOL E10T/10/01 €101 1£8010 €10£60-£11080 B30Ue) 181 00000-00%-00195-0£€P-100€  TOOWO  611¥00
IIRIOIUOIA] JO bﬁu

611F 67019 E10T/HTIOT £10T/10/01 £101 0£8010 £10£60-£11080 B30ULD 1184 00000-00%-00195-0£EP-100€  TOOWOW  611¥00
IIBJOIUOTA] JO me

611% 76019 ELOTAHTIOL £10Z/10/01 E101 628010 £10£60-£11080 eZoU)) 078t 00000-005-00195-0E€H-100€  TOOWOIN  611+00
TR[IUOIN 3o 410

611F 6019 £10TT/01 £107/10/01 £101 878010 £10£60-£11080 BS0URD 0Z8Y 00000-00+-00195-0EEP-100€  TOMUON  611¥00
IRpIToOAN 3o A1)

611¥ ¥T'99¢ E10Z/4+T/01 £10T/10/01 €101 LT80T0 ETOEG0-ET1T080 ISIPYULY ££E0T 00000-00%-00195-0£EP-100E  TOOWIOIN 61100
IROIUOIA 3O AU

6L1% ¥T99¢ E10THZ/01 £10Z/10/01 €101 €Z8010 £10€60-£ 11080 ASISTUIY ¢L T 00000-00F-00195-0EEF-100E  TOOIUOI 61 1+00
TEIIUOW Jo A1)

611+ ¥T'99€ £102/7T/01 £10T/10/01 £101 ¥Z8010 £10£60-£1 1080 B19PRI 06EC] 00000~007-0019$-0EEF-T100E  TOOWOW  611¥00
RO JO AU

3887 $T'99¢ £10ZHT/01 £102/10/01 £101 728010 £10£60-£1 1080 B10PRIT 08E0T 00000-00F-00E9$-0£EFT100€  ZOOWOIN 611400

000LL'S $LLFOQ HIsyonop

QWU SouUBUUIR 2deasplR]

gIl¥ 00'S6Z°C E10ZT/HT/01 £10Z/2T/01 E/L/VILSY adesspuejer-edoue) 118¥ 00000-00F-0L19¢-0€EH-100€  TIOPURT  811H00
apuIIur] SdUeuNuTRy 2deospue]

81l¥ 00°SL¥ £10Z/T/01 £10T/£T/01 £1/01-118% Juswnuny sen-Edoue)) 118 00000-00P-0019S-0EEF-T00E  TIOPWET  §T1H00

£TL LTI$00 30Uan0A
biakilig] Junowy ANedq g Od 218 AUl ON AUF uondiisag JAGUIN N JUNOIDVIUEN/ON JOPUIA IIYINOA




€ a8ed (d 128 - €10T/90/11 ) IquImN 10pusA A 1918139y 12YaN0A - dV
10TAIST(] JoTB M BISTA QIUOA

AL $9°0£9 E10Z/+T/01 £10T/F0/01 E101 TOTTOOLO EIH00T-£1L080 BS0OURD) [18% 00000-00t-0019S-0EEFL00E  FLOWOW  0T1H00
PUSICT 1978 M, BISIA SIUOTA

0TI¥ 8oy £10Z/%Z/01 £10Z40/01 £101 TOOZOOLO £1#001-€1L080 B3OUED [18¥ 00000-001-00196-0£EP-T100E  PLOIWOIW  OZTH00
IDINSIC] IR AL BISTA TUON

oTly LY EET £10T/4Z/01 £10T/40/01 £101 TORTO0LO ETPO0OT-CTLO0 BTOURD (Z8Y 00000-00t-00195-0£EV-T00E  PLOWOIN  0Z1H00
IOTNSI(Y 1T AN BISTA U0

0Tl¥ O L¥T £10Z/4Z/01 £10T/0/01 £101 Z09100LO ETHO0T-S1L080 BFOULD 0Z8Y 00000-001-0019C-0€£-T00€  FLOWOIN  0Z1+00
TOLESI(T ESTB M BISIA SIUOTA]

0TIr LY 6¥T €10T/+T/01 EL0T/H0/01 £101 90ZF1L90 £IF00E-C1L0S0 1SI2YWY £1€01 00000-00t-0019S-0EEP- 1008 PLOWOW  OZTH00
19LS1(T IAIB M BISTA SO

0zt 1rzst E10TAT/01 £10T/40/01 €101 SOTFILI0 E1F00T-E1LOSD ISIBYUNY £ZE0T 00000-00+-0819S-0EE-100€  FLOMWOW  OZTH00
1OLUSICY H91RA, BISIA SIUOIN

0T1Y R1+TC £10T/¥T/01 E10TH0/01 €101 100F1L90 EIF00T-E1L080 ISIBTY £EEOT 00000-00F-00195-0E€P-100€  FLOWOW  OTIH00
12LASICY 118 M, BISIA SIUON

0Ty 06062 E10Z/YT/OL £10Z/70/01 €101 90SE1L90 €1¥001-C1L080 ISIOGUIY £R€01] 00000-00F-00T95-0£€-T100€  FLOMWOW  0ZTH00
10IISIC] JoJe A BISIA U0

0TH I1°6E2 £10T/HT/0L £10Z/70/01 €101 SOSTELO0 E1¥001-£1L080 ISIDYWY 0101 00000-00%-00195-0CEY-100E YL 0Z1+00
PINSIT 1B AN BISTA IJUON

0zly LY 161 £10THT/0L £10Z/40/01 £101 S0880L90 £1¥00T1-£1L080 1SIYUTY 06£01 00000-00F-00195-0E£H-100€  PLOWOW  OZ1+00
IDIBSI(T ITBAN BISTA 2IUOTN

0Tt 9T EFT £10Z/4T/01 £10Z/40/01 E10T £0L80LOO £1P001-£1L080 1SIBUUTY 0Z£01 00000-00%-00195-0€EH- 1008 PL(IWOW  OZT1H00
IDIGSL(T 1A BISTA JJUOIN

0TH 19v2e E10Z/VZ/01 EL0T/F0/01 €101 Z0TROLYO E17001-£1L080 BISGUY 0££01 00000-00F-0019$-0EEH- 1008 PLOWOW  OTIF00
ILSICT 1B BISTA SIUOTA

0Tly OT'EVT €10ZAT/01 €10Z/Y0/01 €101 ZO180L90 E1001-€1L080 A2[53UTY §LT¥ 00000-00%-00195-0€EH-100€  PLOIWOW  OZ1+00
OLRSI(] JSTR AN BISTA SIUON

0zl¥ STHIT £10Z/4T/01 ET0TH0/0T ET01 $0¥S0L90 £TH00T-£1L080 BI9PRIJ £E£0T 00000-00F-00195-0EEF-100€  PLOWIOIN  OTIH00
IDENSICT I21B M, BISIA UOTA

0zly LEFET E10Z/42Z/01 EE0Z/H0/0T £101 S0SH0LY0 €1¥001-€1L080 BIOPRIS (60T 00000-00t-0019S-0ESH-100E  PLAUOW  OTIF00
OLISICT 1VBAN BISIA U0

74 2 19°LE1 £10Z/42/01 £10T/40/01 £101 SOFF0LS0 £1¥001-€1L080 BISPRIF (RE0T 00000-00-00195-0EEF-100€  PLOBIOIN  OTIHOD
WLNSI(] IS12 A BISTA S3UOW

0zly 650LS €10Z/+Z/01 £10T/£0/01 €101 S00T10T90 £1£00T-€19080 POOMULIID 16701 00000-00v-00196-0E£EP-100E  PLOMIO  OTIHO0
WUISI(T IS18M BISTA U0

0zly Y018 £10ZHZ/01 £10Z/10/01 £101 80021550 £1T001-E1£080 81U C1201 00000-00b-0019S-0£EH-100€  YLOMOW  0ZTHO0
’ 12L0ST(T I8\ BISLA U0

0Ty PEFEE €10Z/+Z/01 £10Z/10/01 £101 S0911650 E1T00T-E1E080 [EHUR]) CEZ01 00000-007-0019S-0EEH-100E  PLOIOW  OTIHO0

89'1#1°L 61100 S19YON0A

IO Jo A1)

3137 v'99¢ £10Z/4Z/01 £10Z/10/01 £101 9FFLyD €10€60-C11080 BIOPRIT £€£01 00000-007-0019S-0EEF-100€  ZOMUOIW 611100

b:psliig) junoury B Jwg Od e AUy ON AU] wondiasa( AQUEINN JENOIIY IWEBN/ON 10DUIA JIUINOA




t 98eg

(Wd [T:E - £107/90/11 ) RQuiny Jopus p Ag J21SI1857 J2YIN0A - JV

¥6'¥E0°9T R0, modsy
8YESE ZTIP00 HoYINoA
00y SBD) BIWIOTHE)) WISN0S
7z ¥'oT £10T/4T/01 ET0T/FT/01 O ¥8¥68£7L861 ET0T0T-E11 160 SISUUIY PEEG 00000-00F-00T9S-OEEF-100E  1Z0INOS  ZTIHO0
0]} SBO) BIWLIQI[RY) WaYINeg
w2 8L ST £10Z/+T/01 €I0Z/IT/0T 0T 600S6£TE681 £16001-£ 11160 B30URD OZ8Y 00000-GOY-00T9S-0EEF-100€  [Z0MOS  TTIFO0
00) SBD) BILIOJI[R,) WdINeg
T 9TTLI €10T/PZ/01 €I0Z/11/0T 01 900S6£T8LST E16001-€11160 B30UBD 118¥ 00000-00V-0019S-0SEF-100€  TTOMOS  ZZIHO0
ET6IL [ZI00 “I5Yon0A
07) UOSTpH BIOII[RD) W0
121+ 00°¢S ELOZFT/1 €10Z/11/01 €10 OLOLBELEET ET010T-C11160 PI2A OFRd b5 00000-00v-00195-0SEH-E00€  810WOS  1ZI¥00
00) UOSTPH BILIOIE)) WAINOS
171y TIEL ET10T4T/01 EI0Z/I1/01 €101 899656515 €16001-£10160 SIOYUNY 0ZE01/0EE0] 00000-00F-00195-0EEP-100€  8IMNOS  TIH00
00) UOSIPY BILIOJIFE]) LISYIN0S
121¥ 85LE £10ZATI01 EL0T/60/01 €101 STETHLSIET £18001-E16060 ISIYWY DIH0] 00000-00F-00195-0EEP-100€ - 810MOS  [ZTH00
0 UOSIPF BILIOJI[E]) WIDYINOG
121 SS I €10Z/4T/01 €10T/60/01 €101 06LTTLSRIT £1800T-€16060 »I3pRId 08E01 00000-00%-0019S-0E€F-100€  810MOS  [Z1+00
0)) UOSIPF BIWIOII[2) WIA[NOS
1Zly LV'98T €10Z/+TI01 £10Z/01/01 €101 £L1881850T £16001-€10160 B30Us) 118Y 00000-00%-00195-0EEH-100€  8I0MOS  IZ1+00
0 TOSIp B0 Wanog
2% 087052 €10T/HT/01 €10Z/01/0T €101 696L818€0T £16001-€ 10160 230U 0T8Y 00000~007-0019S-0£EF-100€  810IMOS  1Z1%00
0 UOSIPH BILUOII[RD WIRYINOS
FAL 1L+T ET0TAT/O1 €10Z/01/01 €101 88665TYZ0T £16001-€10160 2120 BS0UR) 118% 00000-00%-00195-0€EH-T100E 810108 1ZIH00
70°5E5°S 0ZT1¥00 JoUonoA
hintlilg) junowy are(] g 0Od e aul ON] AN nonduasa(g J2QUWIN N JUNOIIYVIWEN/ON I0PUIA IYIN0 A




CITY OF MONTCLAIR
HOUSING AUTHORITY
TREASURER'S REPORT

FOR THE MONTH ENDING

October 31, 2013



TABLE OF CONTENTS

SCHEDULE 1 - STATEMENT OF CASH AND INVESTMENTS

CASH AND INVESTMENTS GRAPH



Schedule 1

CITY OF MONTCLAIR
HOUSING AUTHORITY
STATEMENT OF CASH AND INVESTMENTS
October 31, 2013

Interest
Rate Amount

Checking Account
US Bank 497 118.74
Investments
LAIF 3 0.00
TOTAL CASH & INVESTMENTS $ 497,118.74
NOTE:

Pursuant to the Authority's Investment Policy, alt moneys are invested in banks, the Local Agency
investment Fund, and in securities with maturities of no greater than three years.

The Authority has sufficient funds available to meet expenditures during the six-month period ending
April 30, 2014,

During October 2013, the Authority was in compliance with the internal controf procedures set forth in its
Investment Policy.

IAA L &
Michael Piotrowski
Finance Supervisor

Z\Department_Shares\Finance\SecureMontclair Housing AuthorityAMHA Treasurers reports\MHA TR October 13.xls



%0 001
WUN0o2Y Buiyosyn

%00
pun 4 JUSWSaAU|
Aouaby [e207

6L1°26¥$ - sjuawsaAu] @ yse |gjol

€10Z ‘L€ 4840300
HdVd9 SIN3IW1IS3IANI ANV HSVO
ALIMOHLNY ONISNOH
HIVIOLNON 40 ALID




CITY OF MONTCLAIR
HOUSING AUTHORITY
WARRANT REGISTER

FOR THE MONTH ENDING

October 31, 2013



City of Montclair
Final Warrant Register
Council Date 11/18/13

Regular Warrants

Checking Account: MHA

US Bank
Voided  transfers -
Warrants Checks out. Totals
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
October 2013 Total 0.00

No payables activity this period

Vice Chairman Ruh




